EXHIBIT A

SECTION 5

PRICING SCHEDULE

City of Delray Beach

Group | - Material Only (Under 2,000 Sq. ft.) Pick Up by the City or City’s Representative:

ITB No. 2025-047

Annual Sod and Sod Installation Services

e; Biffeans Danzkjptinn Per Sc?:::e foot Per ::t?aert: foot
1 St. Augustine Solid Sod No Bid $0.48
2 St. Augustine Floratam No Bid $0.48
3 St. Augustine Palmetto No Bid $0.50
4 Bahia Argentine No Bid $0.37
S Bahia Pensacola No Bid No Bid
6 Certified Bermuda $0.62 $0.62

7 Bermuda Celebration $0.62 $0.62

8 | Pine Straw Mulch No Bid No Bid
9 Seed and Mulch No Bid No Bid
10 | Hydro Seed No Bid No Bid




Group |l - Material & Delivery Only {Over 2,000 Sq. ft. and Under 40,000 Sq.ft.} No

City of Delray Beach

ITB No. 2025-047

Annual Sod and Sod Installation Services

g R ) Description Per S::::e foot Per s':;:'::: foot
11 | St. Augustine Solid Sod Floratam No Bid $0.52
12 | St. Augustine Floratam No Bid $0'52
13 | St. Augustine Palmetto No Bid $0.54
14 | Bahia Argentine No Bid $0.39
15 | Bahia Pensacola No Bid No Bid
16 Certified Bermuda $0.65 $0.65
17 | Bermuda Celebration $0.65 $0.65
18 | Pine Straw Mulch No Bid No Bid
19 | Seed and Muich No Bid No Bid
20 | Hydro Seed No Bid No Bid




Group lll - Material & Delivery Onl

City of Delray Beach

ITB No. 2025-047

Annual Sod and Sod Installation Services

No. Bid Item Description Per S::;Irse foot Per Sl:qat:laert: foot
21 | St. Augustine Solid Sod No Bid $0.52
22 | St. Augustine Floratam No Bid $0.52
23 | St. Aug. Palmetto No Bid $0.54
24 | Bahia Argentine No Bid $039
25 | Bahia Pensacola No Bid No Bid
26 | Certified Bermuda $0.65 $0.65

27 | Bermuda Celebration $0.65 $0.65
28 | Pine Straw Mulch No Bid No Bid
29 | Seed and Mulch No Bid No Bid
30 | Hydro Seed No Bid No Bid




Group IV - “Labor Only”

City of Delray Beach
ITB No. 2025-047
Annual Sod and Sod Installation Services

: o Rolls Pallets

i B Seey Dessarption Per Square foot Per Square foot
31 | Delivery & Unload - Under 2,000 sq.ft. $0.12 $0.12
32 | Delivery & Unload - 2,000 sq.ft. or more $0.12 $0.12
33 | Delivery + Installation - Under 2,000 sq.ft. $0'20 $0 20
34 | Delivery + Installation - 2,000 sq.ft. or more $0.20 $0.20
35 | RIP/ Remove + Installation + Roll - Under 2,000 sq.ft. $0.25 $0.25
36 | RIP/ Remove + Installation + Roll - 2,000 sq.ft. or more $0.25 $0.25

RIP/ Remove + Laser Grading + Installation
37| + Roll - Under 2,000 sq.ft 30.35 30.35
38 RIP/ Remove + Laser Grading + Installation $0.35 $0_35

+ Roll - 2,000 sq.ft. or more

Additional Soil Amendment per Cu.
3 | Yd. 50/50 Mod/Sand $40/yd




City of Delray Beach
ITB No. 2025-047
Annual Sod and Sod Installation Services

S s0dl Fromy Growiag Fage L pcet
« st Augustine Solid soa: JW Turf Farms / Belle Glade

e St Augustine Floratam: JW Turf FarmS / Be”e Glade

e St Augustine Palmetto: JW Turf Farms / Belle Glade

e Bahia Argentine: DRK Holdings / Okeechobee County

e Bahia Pensacola: None

e Certified Bermuda: W Tuf Farms / Okeechobee County

Bermuda Celebration: JW Turf Farms / Okeechobee County

Bidder Company Name: Odums SOdL Inc.

)
Signature of Official authorized to bind Bidder : 0\/* {pw‘

AN

Print Name:  VVarren L Prescott, Jr, Tite: President
Date: 8-19'2025

Contact Office Tel: 261-370-3624 Contact Cel: 961-539-6730

Contact Emai: 0dUmssod @yahoo.co

Eailure to fully comolete and sign this Bid Form may result io reigction of the Bid,



