

Item No.	Product Number / Description	Estimated Annual Qty	FERGUSON ENTERPRISES, INC.			FORTILINE, INC. DBA FORTILINE WATERWORKS			HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS, LTD.			MELROSE SUPPLY & SALES CORP		
			Bidder Item / Product Number	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bidder Item / Product Number	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bidder Item / Product Number	Unit Price	Extended Price	Bidder Item / Product Number	Unit Price	Extended Price
1	4415RW18	1-1/2X1/8 RUBBER MTR WASHER	2500	\$	0.70	\$ 1,750.00				\$	0.32	\$ 800.00	NO BID	\$ -
2	4420RW18	2X1/8 RUBBER MTR WASHER	1000	\$	0.77	\$ 770.00				\$	0.40	\$ 400.00	NO BID	\$ -
3	804040SWB	PIPE PVC 4X20 SCH40 SWB (C)	940	\$	1.60	\$ 1,504.00				\$	2.07	\$ 1,945.80		\$ 1.49 \$ 1,397.59
4	80745BE050	RAIN A46010 SBE050 ELBOW SPIRA	700	\$	0.15	\$ 105.00	NO BID	\$ -		\$	0.13	\$ 91.00		\$ 0.11 \$ 80.36
5	0915E200C18	1-1/2X100 PE TUBE 200PSI BLUE	600	\$	0.73	\$ 438.00				\$	0.88	\$ 528.00	NO BID	\$ -
6	0106350T	6 TJ PR350 CL50 DI PIPE CA	500	\$	13.50	\$ 6,750.00				\$	13.75	\$ 6,875.00	NO BID	\$ -
7	8067024LP	TORO 5702-4LP 4" POP-UP LOW	450	\$	1.60	\$ 720.00				\$	1.51	\$ 679.50		\$ 1.17 \$ 525.69
8	807615H	TORO 89-1767 15-H NOZZLE	450	\$	1.40	\$ 630.00				\$	1.37	\$ 616.50		\$ 1.07 \$ 483.21
9	0208188	8 C900 DR18 PVC PIPE BLUE (G)	440	\$	6.60	\$ 2,904.00				\$	7.25	\$ 3,190.00	NO BID	\$ -
10	8040010SWB	PIPE PVC 1X20 SCH40 SWB (C)	300	\$	0.25	\$ 75.00				\$	0.32	\$ 96.00		\$ 0.26 \$ 77.88
11	804005SWB	PIPE PVC 1/2X20 SCH40 SWB (C)	300	\$	0.15	\$ 45.00				\$	0.16	\$ 48.00		\$ 0.15 \$ 45.00
12	98WGC14	WADE WC-14 SPLICE KIT W/GEL	300	\$	2.00	\$ 600.00				\$	0.65	\$ 195.00	NO BID	\$ -
13	80PGP04	HUNTER PGP-04 ULTRA 4" POP-UP	280	\$	10.90	\$ 3,052.00				\$	9.53	\$ 2,668.40		\$ 8.99 \$ 2,516.33
14	0206188	6 C900 DR18 PVC PIPE BLUE (G)	260	\$	3.90	\$ 1,014.00				\$	4.20	\$ 1,092.00	NO BID	\$ -
15	805BCPLG	RAIN A46005 SBCLPG COUPLING	250	\$	0.21	\$ 52.50				\$	0.23	\$ 57.50		\$ 0.18 \$ 41.65
16	2900540AHM	1/2 PVC SCH40 MALE ADPT HXMIPT	200	\$	0.13	\$ 26.00				\$	0.16	\$ 32.00		\$ 0.12 \$ 23.98
17	2900540CT	1/2 PVC S40 THRD CAP FIPT	200	\$	0.27	\$ 54.00				\$	0.33	\$ 66.00		\$ 0.26 \$ 51.00
18	80RBA46011	RAIN A46011 SBE075 ELBOW SPIRA	200	\$	0.16	\$ 32.00				\$	0.16	\$ 32.00		\$ 0.13 \$ 25.04
19	804007SWB	PIPE PVC 3/4X20 SCH40 SWB (C)	200	\$	0.19	\$ 37.60				\$	0.23	\$ 46.00		\$ 0.18 \$ 35.40
20	804015SWB	PIPE PVC 11/2X20 SCH40 SWB (C)	200	\$	0.42	\$ 83.20				\$	0.52	\$ 104.00		\$ 0.39 \$ 77.78
21	804020SWB	PIPE PVC 2X20 SCH40 SWB (C)	200	\$	0.55	\$ 110.40				\$	0.71	\$ 142.00		\$ 0.52 \$ 104.38
22	8067026LP	TORO 5702-6LP 6" SPRINKER FOR	200	\$	6.30	\$ 1,260.00				\$	6.43	\$ 1,286.00		\$ 5.00 \$ 1,000.00
23	807615F	TORO 89-1764 15-F NOZZLE	200	\$	1.40	\$ 280.00				\$	1.37	\$ 274.00		\$ 1.07 \$ 214.76
24	0503080	2X20 PVC SCH80 GRAY PIPE SWB	180	\$	3.13	\$ 563.40				\$	1.45	\$ 261.00		\$ 2.52 \$ 454.01
25	807615Q	TORO 89-1769 15-Q NOZZLE	175	\$	1.40	\$ 245.00				\$	1.37	\$ 239.75		\$ 1.07 \$ 187.92
26	80764X30SST	TORO 89-1796 4X30-SST NOZZLE	175	\$	1.40	\$ 245.00				\$	1.37	\$ 239.75		\$ 1.07 \$ 187.92
27	2900540SHH	1/2 PVC S40 CPLG HXH 429-005	150	\$	0.09	\$ 13.50				\$	0.11	\$ 16.50		\$ 0.09 \$ 13.08
28	2901040SHH	1 PVC S40 CPLG HXH 429-010	150	\$	0.22	\$ 33.00				\$	0.27	\$ 40.50		\$ 0.21 \$ 31.73
29	0502080	2X20 PVC SCH80 GRAY PIPE SWB	140	\$	1.64	\$ 230.20				\$	1.08	\$ 151.20		\$ 1.24 \$ 172.90
30	804060SWB	PIPE PVC 6X20 SCH40 SWB (C)	140	\$	2.83	\$ 396.64				\$	3.64	\$ 509.60		\$ 2.81 \$ 393.18
31	45WC0011182TR	CDR COVER 11X18X2 W/TOUCH READ	125	\$	29.30	\$ 3,662.50				\$	33.13	\$ 4,141.25	NO BID	\$ -
32	80670212LPS	TORO 5702-12LPS 12" POP-UP FOR	125	\$	10.90	\$ 1,362.50				\$	9.85	\$ 1,231.25		\$ 8.33 \$ 1,041.35
33	0910E200C18	1X100 BLUE PE TUBING CTS	100	\$	0.32	\$ 32.00				\$	0.41	\$ 41.00	NO BID	\$ -
34	2900540TH005F	1/2 SCH40 TEE HXFPT 402-005	100	\$	0.23	\$ 23.00				\$	0.28	\$ 28.00		\$ 0.22 \$ 22.02
35	29007409HH	3/4 PVC SCH40 90 HXH 406-007	100	\$	0.16	\$ 16.00				\$	0.19	\$ 19.00		\$ 0.15 \$ 15.05
36	2901040RS007H	1X3/4 PVC S40 BUS SPXH 437-131	100	\$	0.26	\$ 26.00				\$	0.32	\$ 32.00		\$ 0.26 \$ 25.50
37	29010409HH	1 PVC SCH40 90 HXH 406-010	100	\$	0.28	\$ 28.00				\$	0.35	\$ 35.00		\$ 0.27 \$ 26.80
38	2901540SHH	1-1/2 SCH40 CPLG HXH 429-015	100	\$	0.33	\$ 33.00				\$	0.40	\$ 40.00		\$ 0.31 \$ 31.16
39	804030SWB	PIPE PVC 3X20 SCH40 SWB (C)	100	\$	1.15	\$ 114.70				\$	1.45	\$ 145.00		\$ 1.12 \$ 112.10
40	44MM15RMCNL	1-1/2 METER CPLG (EA) NO LEAD	98	\$	27.50	\$ 2,695.00				\$	15.87	\$ 1,555.26	NO BID	\$ -
41	2904040AHF	4 SCH40 FEMALE ADAPT HXFPT	93	\$	3.10	\$ 288.30				\$	3.80	\$ 353.40		\$ 2.95 \$ 274.42
42	2704W04HHDWV	4 PVC SCH40 DWV WYE HXH	90	\$	8.80	\$ 792.00				\$	30.39	\$ 2,735.10	NO BID	\$ -
43	3910C4444GNL	C44-44-G-NL 1" CPLG GJCTS GRIP	78	\$	13.80	\$ 1,076.40	NO BID	\$ -		\$	15.50	\$ 1,209.00	NO BID	\$ -
44	4420MNCNL	2 REGULAR METER CPLG (EA) NL	74	\$	38.20	\$ 2,826.80				\$	22.00	\$ 1,628.00	NO BID	\$ -
45	29007511807	NDS 3/4 EXPANS CPLG 118-07	72	\$	3.30	\$ 237.60				\$	3.64	\$ 262.08		\$ 2.06 \$ 148.53
46	0505080	1/2X20 PVC SCH80 PIPE SWB	60	\$	0.38	\$ 22.56				\$	0.24	\$ 14.40		\$ 0.34 \$ 20.53
47	0500780	3/4X20 PVC SCH80 PIPE SWB	60	\$	0.54	\$ 32.16				\$	0.32	\$ 19.20		\$ 0.41 \$ 24.78
48	0501080	1X20 PVC SCH80 GRAY PIPE SWB	60	\$	0.68	\$ 40.82				\$	0.47	\$ 28.20		\$ 0.53 \$ 31.94
49	21AMGB06	6 MJ REGULAR ACC SET LGLAND	54	\$	10.00	\$ 540.00				\$	9.37	\$ 505.98	NO BID	\$ -
50	2900540AHF	1/2 PVC S40 FEM ADPT 435-005	50	\$	0.17	\$ 8.50				\$	0.19	\$ 9.50		\$ 0.15 \$ 7.53
51	2900740CH	3/4 PVC SCH40 SW CAP 447-007	50	\$	0.15	\$ 7.50				\$	0.19	\$ 9.50		\$ 0.14 \$ 6.98
52	2900740SHH	3/4 PVC SCH40 CPLG HXH 429-007	50	\$	0.13	\$ 6.50				\$	0.16	\$ 8.00		\$ 0.12 \$ 6.00
53	2900740TH005F	3/4X1/2 PVC S40 TEE HXFPT	50	\$	0.31	\$ 15.50				\$	0.37	\$ 18.50		\$ 0.29 \$ 14.61
54	2900740TH007H	3/4 PVC SCH40 TEE HXH 401-007	50	\$	0.21	\$ 10.50				\$	0.24	\$ 12.00		\$ 0.19 \$ 9.48
55	2901040AHF	1 SCH40 FE AD HXFPT 435-010	50	\$	0.23	\$ 11.50				\$	0.28	\$ 14.00		\$ 0.22 \$ 11.01
56	2901040TH005F	1X1/2 PVC S40 T HXFPT 402-130	50	\$	0.45	\$ 22.50				\$	0.57	\$ 28.50		\$ 0.44 \$ 22.13
57	2901040TH010H	1 PVC SCH40 TEE HXH 401-010	50	\$	0.37	\$ 18.50				\$	0.45	\$ 22.50		\$ 0.36 \$ 17.77
58	29010404HH	1 PVC SCH40 45 HXH 417-010	50	\$	0.42	\$ 21.00				\$	0.53	\$ 26.50		\$ 0.41 \$ 20.49
59	2901240RS010H	1-1/4X1 PVC S40 BUSH SPXH	50	\$	0.35	\$ 17.50				\$	0.44	\$ 22.00		\$ 0.34 \$ 17.11
60	29012409HH	1-1/4 PVC SCH40 90 HXH 406-012	50	\$	0.48	\$ 24.00				\$	0.61	\$ 30.50		\$ 0.48 \$ 23.76
61	2901540AHF	1-1/2 SCH40 FEM ADPT 435-015	50	\$	0.41	\$ 20.50				\$	0.51	\$ 25.50		\$ 0.39 \$ 19.61
62	2901540AHM	1-1/2 SCH40 M AD HXH 436-015	50	\$	0.40	\$ 20.00				\$	0.51	\$ 25.50		\$ 0.39 \$ 19.61
63	2901540RS010H	1-1/2X1 PVC SCH40 BUSH SPXH	50	\$	0.37	\$ 18.50				\$	0.47	\$ 23.50		\$ 0.36 \$ 17.99
64	2901540RS012H	1-1/2X1-1/4 SCH40 BUSH SPXH	50	\$	0.37	\$ 18.50				\$	0.48	\$ 24.00		\$ 0.36 \$ 17.99
65	29015409HH	1-1/2 PVC SCH40 90 HXH 406-015	50	\$	0.53	\$ 26.50				\$	0.65	\$ 32.50		\$ 0.51 \$ 25.40
66	2902040AHM	2 SCH40 ML AD HXMIPT 436-020	50	\$	0.53	\$ 26.50				\$	0.65	\$ 32.50		\$ 0.51 \$ 25.61
67	29020409HH	2 PVC SCH40 90 HXH 406-020	50	\$	0.82	\$ 41.00				\$	1.03	\$ 51.50		\$ 0.80 \$ 39.88
68	8067023LP	TORO 5702-3LP 3"POP-UP LOW PRE	50	\$	2.30	\$ 115.00				\$	2.19	\$ 109.50		\$ 1.70 \$ 84.96
69	8076570S	TORO 9-6807 SHRUB ADAPTER BODY	50	\$	0.87	\$ 43.50				\$	0.85	\$ 42.50		\$ 0.66 \$ 33.04
Total				\$	38,361.14			\$ 38,014.62		\$	32,790.95			\$ 11,140.70