City of Delray Beach
ITB No. 2026-018
Purchase of Road Construction Matearials

SECTION 4
BID SUBMITTAL SIGNATURE PAGE

This Page and all following pages comprise your original Bid Submittal package.

Please also attach any additional information or documentation requested in this Invitation to Bid.
There is no need to include the preceding Sections 1 and 2 in your Bid Submittal package.

By signing this Bid the Bidder certifies that it satisfies all legal requirements as an entity to do business
with the City, including all Conflict of Interest and Code of Ethics provisions.

Firm Name: Austin Tupler Trucking Inc.

Street Address: 6570 Sw 47th Ct Davie Fl, 33314

Mailing Address (if different than Street Address):

Telephone Number(s): (954) 583-0801

Fax Number(s): N/A

Email Address: Tupler@tuplertrucking.com

Federal Employer Identification Number: 59-1426412
Signature:

\) (Signature of authorized agent)

Print Name: Glen Tupler

Title: President

By signing this document, the Bidder agrees to all Terms and Conditions of this Solicitation and the
resulting Contract/Agreement.

THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF BIDDER TO BE BOUND BY

THE TERMS OF ITS OFFER, FOR NOT LESS THAN 120 DAYS, AND THE BIDDER’S UNEQUIVOCAL OFFERTO

BE BOUND BY THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS SET FORTH IN THIS INVITATION TO BID. FAILURE TO SIGN

THIS SOLICITATION WHERE INDICATED ABOVE, BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE, SHALL RENDER

THE BID NON-RESPONSIVE. THE CITY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION, ACCEPT ANY BID THAT

INCLUDES AN EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE BIDDER TO THE TERMS OF
ITS OFFER.

END OF SECTION 4



City of Delray Beach
ITB No. 2026-018
Purchase of Road Construction Materials

SECTION 11
SOLICITATION SUMMARY

The City of Delray Beach
100 N.W. 15t Avenue
Delray Beach, FL 33444

PURCHASING DIVISION

SOLICITATION SUMMARY

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information you provide on this page will be read aloud at the PUBLIC OPENING for this Solicitation.
Itis VERY IMPORTANT that the summary information you provide below is exactly the same information
contained in your Bid. If subsequent to the opening of Bids, the City determines that the information
contained in the electronic version of your Bid is different from the information on this Solicitation
Summary, the City reserves the right to deem your Bid NON-RESPONSIVE and remove your Bid from
further evaluation and consideration for contract award.

BID INFORMATION

Bid Number: ITB No. 2026-018
Title: Purchase of Road Construction Materials
Due Date and Time: February 17, 2026 @ 2:00 AM EST
Name of Bidder: AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.
Address: 6570 SW 47TH CT. DAVIE, FLORIDA 33314
Contact Person: GLEN TUPLER
Bid Amount: $f{’j:ﬁ§4 353.50
Q)
Authorized Signature: P. -
Date: 03/03/2026

By signing and submitting this Solicitation Summary, the Bidder affirms that the information provided
above is an exact and correct summary of the information contained in the electronic version of the
Bidder’s Bid to the City of Delray Beach.

THIS SOLICITATION SUMMARY MUST BE SIGNED AND INCLUDED WITH YOUR SECURE ELECTRONIC BID SUBMITTAL
THROUGH https://www.bidnetdirect.com/florida/cityofdelraybeach




5.1

City of Delray Beach
ITB No. 2026-018
Purchase of Road Construction Materials

SECTION 5
PRICING SCHEDULE

PRICES AND RATES

Bids will be accepted through a secure mailbox at Bidnet Direct
(https://www.bidnetdirect.com/florida/cityofdelraybeach) until the Deadline for Submission
as indicated in this ITB. The City will only accept electronic bids for this ITB. Late Bids will not be
accepted.

In addition to the “Place Offer” bid submission section, the Bidder shall indicate in the spaces
provided, the firm and fixed prices and rates offered to the City for the goods and/or services
described below.

Bidders must bid on All line items to be responsive and responsible

CITY OF DELRAY BEACH

bl GROUP A: ROAD MATERIALS-ASPHALTS
No. | {tem Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
1 Type Il Asphalt 50 tons $134.60 $_6,730.00
2 Type Ill Asphalt 300 tons $134.60 $_40,380.00
3 Cold Patch Asphalt 120 tons $180.00 $_21.600.00
4 Tac Oil, RC#70 500 gals $0.00 $_No Bid
5 Permanent Cold 100 pails $.0.00 $_No Bid
Patch, 55 Ib. pail
6 60 Ib. bag of Ready 550 bags $_0.00 S No Bid
Concrete Mix
TOTAL GROUP A $_68,710.00
___ GROUP B: ROAD MATERIALS NON-ASPHALTS
No. |ltem Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
1 Crushed Coarse 250 tons
Lime Rock $39.40 $ 9.580.00
2 Drainfield Rock %” 100 - tons .
$ 42 65 $_ 426500
3 Best Mason Sand 100 tons
$ 50.00 $ _5.000.00
4 Clean Fill Dirt 500 yards )
$ 16.00 $ 8.000.00
5 Precast Car 200 each
Bumpers w/pins $_111.00 |$_22.200.00
6 DOT Crush Rock- 100 tons
noncertified $.39.40 $.3,940.00
7 #57 Rock 300 tons
$_42.65 |$ _12.795.00




City of Deiray Beach
IT8 No. 2026-018
Purchase of Road Construction Materials

8 Concrete, 300 pump 500 cubic
_ mix with fiber yards $ 0.00 $ No Bid
9 Stabilizer Rock 100 tons
$ 44.65 $_4,465.00
10 Compactable Fill 100 yards
Sand $ 25.90 $ 2.590.00
11 Code 01 Lime Rock 1,200 tons
$ 40.90 $ _49.080.00
12 #4 Ballast Rock 100 tons
$ 42.65 $_426500
13 #5 Ballast Rock 100 tons
$ 44.15 $_4.415.00
TOTAL GROUP B v _
" TOTALGROUPA+ GROUP B $_130.865.00 _
TOTAL ESTIMATED BID PRICE S 199,575.00




CITY OF MARGATE

City of Delray Beach

ITB No. 2026-018

Purchase of Road Construction Materials

0 GROUP A: ROAD MATERIALS-ASPHALTS -~
No. | item Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
gl Type Il Asphalt 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
2 Type Ill Asphalt 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
3 Cold Patch Asphalt 180 Bags
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
4 Tac Oil, RC#70 5 gals
$ _0.00 $ No Bid
S Permanent Cold 0 pails
Patch, 55 Ib. pail $ 0.00 s No Bid
6 60 Ib. bag of Ready 50 bags
Concrete Mix $_0.00 No Bid
ITOTAL GROUP A $__0.00
e ~ GROUP B- ROAD MATERIALS NON-ASPHALTS
No. [item Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
1 Crushed Coarse 20 Cuyds
Lime Rock $ 37.20 $ _744.00
2 Drainfield Rock %" 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
3 Best Mason Sand 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
4 Clean Fill Dirt 0 yards
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
5 Precast Car 10 each
Bumpers w/pins $ _160.00 $ _1.600.00
6 DOT Crush Rock- 0 tons
noncertified s 0.00 $ No Bid
7 #57 Rock 40 Cu yds ’
$ 4070 |5_162800
] Concrete, 300 pump 0 cubic
mix with fiber yards $ 0.00 $ No Bid
9 Stabilizer Rock 0 tons
$ 0.00 S No Bid
10 Compactable Fill 60 Cu yds
Sand $_15.00 $ 900.00
11 Code 01 Lime Rock 0 tons ]
$ 0.00 5 No Bid
12 #4 Ballast Rock 0 tons
$ 0.00 S No Bid
13 #5 Ballast Rock 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
TOTAL GROUP B $_4,872.00
TTOTAL GROUP A + GROUP B 9
TOTAL ESTIMATED BID PRICE § 4 872 00




TOWN OF DAVIE

City of Delray Beach

ITB No. 2026-018

Purchase of Road Construction Materials

b ___GROUP A: ROAD MATERIALS-ASPHALTS
No. item Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
1 Type Il Asphalt 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
2 Type Il Asphalt 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ __No Bid
3 Cold Patch Asphalt 1,200 Bags
$ 0.00 $___No Bid
4 Tac Qil, RC#70 55 gals
$ 0.00 $__ No Bid
5 Permanent Cold 0 pails
Patch, 55 Ib. pail $ 0.00 S No Bid
6 60 Ib. bag of Ready 840 bags
Concrete Mix $000  |$_NoBid
TOTAL GROUP A
$_0.00 $ 0.00
g GROUP B- ROAD MATERIALS NON-ASPHALTS
No. item Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
S i P ons  |s 35.30 | ¢ _21,533.00
) Drainfield Rock %" 600 tons
$40.05 $ 24.030.00
3 Best Mason Sand 320 tons
$43.50 $ 13,920.00
4 Clean Fill Dirt 0 yards
$ 0.00 $ __ No Bid
5 Precast Car 0 each ]
Bumpers w/pins s 0.00 $ No Bid
6 DOT Crush Rock- 0 tons
noncertified $ 0.00 s  No Bid
7 #57 Rock 220 tons
$ 38.80 $ _8.536.00
8 Concrete, 300 pump 0 cubic
mix with fiber yards | $ 0.00 $ No Bid
9 Stabilizer Rock 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
10  |Compactable Fill 0 Cu yds .
Sand $ 0.00 $ No Bid
11 Code 01 Lime Rock 0 tons
s 0.00 s No Bid
12 #4 Ballast Rock 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
13 #5 Ballast Rock 0 tons
s 0.00 $ No Bid
TOTAL GROUP B $ 68,019.00
TOTAL GROUP A + GROUP B 6801900 -
TOTAL ESTIMATED BID PRICE $§ 68.019.00




MIAMI SHORES VILLAGE

City of Delray Beach
{TB No. 2026-018

Purchase of Road Construction Materials

. GROUP A: ROAD MATERIALS-ASPHALTS
No. | jtem Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
1 Type Il Asphalt 50,000 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
2 Type Il Asphalt 10,000 tons
$ 0.00 $ _ No Bid
3 Cold Patch Asphalt 5,000 tons
$187.75 |$_938,750.00
4 Tac Oil, RC#70 0
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
5 Permanent Cold 0
Patch, 55 Ib. pail $ 0.00 $ ___No Bid
6 60 Ib. bag of Ready 1,000 )
Concrete Mix $ 0.00 s __No Bid
TOTAL GROUP A $ 938.750.00
‘ GROUP B- ROAD MATERIALS NON-ASPHALTS
No. [item Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
1l Crushed Coarse 100 yds
Lime Rock $ 53.90 $ _5.380.00
2 Drainfield Rock %" 0 tons
s 0.00 s NoBid
3 Best Mason Sand 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
4 Clean Fill Dirt 100 yds
$ 15.00 $ _1,500.00
5 Precast Car 150 yds
Bumpers w/pins $113.00  |$_16,950.00
6 DOT Crush Rock- 0 tons .
noncertified ¢ 0.00 $ No Bid
7 #57 Rock 100 yds
$ 56.90 $ _5,690.00
IS Concrete, 300 pump 0 cubic
mix with fiber yards | $ 0.00 $ No Bid
9 Stabilizer Rock 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
10 [Compactable Fill 0 tons
Sand $ 0.00 $ No Bid
11 Code 01 Lime Rock 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ __ No Bid
12  #4 Ballast Rock 0 tons
$ 0.00 5 No Bid
13  [#5 Ballast Rock 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
TOTAL GROUP B $ 29,530.00
 TOTALGROUP A+ GROUPB $96828000
TOTAL ESTIMATED BID PRICE $ 968,280.00




CITY OF SUNRISE

City of Delray Beach
ITB No. 2026-018

Purchase of Road Construction Materials

GROUP A: ROAD MATERIALS-ASPHALTS

ltem Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
1 Type Il Asphalt 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ ___No Bid
2 Type Il Asphalt 0 tons
$0.00 $ __ No Bid
3 Cold Patch Asphalt 0 tons
$ 0.00 $ ___No Bid
a4 Tac Oil, RC#70 900 Gallons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
5 Permanent Cold 400 55 lbs
Patch, 55 lb. pail bags $000  |$__ NoBid
6 60 |b. bag of Ready 400 60 lba
Concrete Mix bags $ 0.00 $ No Bid
TOTAL GROUP A 0.00
GROUP B- ROAD MATERIALS NON-ASPHALTS
No. [item Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Cost
1 Crushed Coarse 900 tons
I s 35.30 | 31,770.00
2 Drainfield Rock %” 200 tons
$ 40.05 $ _8,010.00
3 Best Mason Sand 50 tons
$ 43.75 $_2.187.50
4 Clean Fill Dirt 75 tons
$ 0.00 $ No Bid
5 Precast Car 0 yds
Bumpers w/pins $ 0.00 $ No Bid
6 DOT Crush Rock- 0 tons
noncertified $ 0.00 $ No Bid
7 #57 Rock 300 tons
$ 38.80 $_11.640.00
3 Concrete, 300 pump 0 tons
mix with fiber $_0.00 $ No Bid
9 Stabilizer Rock 200 tons
$ _0.00 $ No Bid
10 |Compactable Fill 0 tons
Sand $ 0.00 $ No Bid
11 |Code 01 Lime Rock 0 tons
$ _0.00 $ No Bid
12  #4 Ballast Rock 0 tons
$_0.00 $ No Bid
13  #5 Ballast Rock 0 tons
$_0.00 § No Bid
TOTAL GROUP B $ _53.607.50
- TOTALGROUP A +GROUP B $ _53.607.50
TOTAL ESTIMATED BID PRICE § 53.607.50

END OF SECTION 5



ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA

INSTRUCTIONS: COMPLETE PART | OR PART I, WHICHEVER APPLIES

PART I:

List below the dates of issue for each addendum received in connection with this solicitation:

Addendum #1, Dated 02/17/2026
Addendum #2, Dated 02/24/2026
Addendum #3, Dated 02/24/2026

Addendum #4, Dated

Addendum #5, Dated

Addendum #6, Dated

Addendum #7, Dated

Addendum #8, Dated

Addendum #9, Dated

Addendum #10, Dated

PART II:

(] NO ADDENDUM WAS RECEIVED IN CONNECTION WITH THIS SOLICITATION

AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.

Signature

GLEN TUPLER

PRESIDENT

Name and Title

03/03/2026

Date



SUBMITTAL SIGNATURE PAGE

By signing this document, the Bidder/Proposer certifies that it satisfies all legal requirements as an
entity to do business with the City, including all Conflicts of Interest and Code of Ethics provisions.

Firm Name: Austin Tupler Trucking Inc.

Street Address: 6570 Sw 47th Ct Davie Fl, 33314

Mailing Address (if different from Street Address):

Telephone Number(s): (954) 583 - 0801

Fax Number(s):

Email Address: Tupler@tuplertrucking.com

Federal Employer Identification Number: 59 - 1426412

Prompt Paymer(lft erms: _ 0 % days’net 30 days
Signature: |

\) (Signature of authorized agent)
Print Name: Glen Tupler
Title: President
Date: 03/03/2026

By signing this document, the Bidder/Proposer agrees to all terms and conditions of this solicitation and
the resulting contract/agreement.

THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF BIDDER/PROPOSER TO BE
BOUND BY THE TERMS OF ITS BID/PROPOSAL, FOR NOT LESS THAN 90 DAYS, AND THE
BIDDER’S/PROPOSER’S UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS SET
FORTH IN THIS SOLICITATION. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION WHERE INDICATED ABOVE, BY AN
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE, SHALL RENDER THE BID/PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE CITY
MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION, ACCEPT ANY BID/PROPOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN EXECUTED
DOCUMENT WHICH UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE BIDDER/PROPOSER TO THE TERMS OF ITS
BID/PROPOSAL.




Vendor or Contractor Conflict of Interest
Disclosure Statement
Information and Instructions

The award of this contract is subject to the provisions of Chapter 112, Part Ill, Florida Statutes. The City of Delray Beach,
Florida, requires this disclosure statement to be completed and filed with all proposals, bids responses, contracts, or
grant or loan requests to the City. The disclosure statement is not required for contracts for gas, water, and electric
services where no competition exists, or where rates are fixed by law or ordinance. In circumstances where a contract
is awarded by competitive bid, the disclosure statement shall be required from persons submitting responses to
requests for proposals, requests for qualifications, invitation to bid, grant applications, or other proposals.

A copy of the disclosure statement shall be maintained by the Purchasing Department.

The City of Delray Beach shall not enter into any contract or appropriate any public funds with any person who refuses
to provide information required on the disclosure form.

Any person who provides misleading or incorrect information on the disclosure statement shall be disqualified from
participation. Also, the contract or grant shall be voidable by the City if the misleading or incorrect information on the
disclosure statement is discovered by the City subsequent to execution of a contract.

Definitions

"Business Entity" means any corporation, partnership, limited partnership, proprietorship, firm, enterprise, franchise,
association, self-employed individual, or trust, whether fictitiously named or not, doing business in the State of Florida.

"Family, or Family Members, or Familial Relationship" means included but limited to individuals who are related to
a public official as father, mother, son, daughter, brother, sister, husband, wife, father-in-law, mother-in-law, son-in-
law, daughter-in-law, brother-in-law, sister-in-law, half brother, half sister, person who is engaged to be married to a
public official or who otherwise holds himself or herself out as or is generally known as the person whom a pubilic official
intends to marry or with whom a public official intends to form or has formed a household.

“Person” means an individual, firm, partnership, association, joint venture, cooperative, or corporation, or any other
group or combination acting in concert.

“Public Official” means a person either elected to a governmental position, or appointed to a governmental position
who is authorized by statute, resolution or charter to exercise part of the sovereign power of the governmental entity
and whose duties of involve the exercise of discretion on behalf of the governmental entity. This also includes all City
Employees.

Instructions

Complete all lines as indicated. If an item does not apply, denote N/A (not applicable). If you cannot include
required information in the space provided, attach additional sheets as necessary.



CITY OF DELRAY BEACH
VENDOR OR CONTRACTOR CONFLICT
OF INTEREST DISCLOSURE FORM

Austin Tupler Trucking Inc

ENTITY COMPLETING FORM

6570 Sw 47th Ct

ADDRESS

Davie Fl, 33314 (954) 583-0801
CITY, STATE, ZIP TELEPHONE NUMBER
Tupler@tuplertrucking.com (954) 296-7859
CONTACT EMAIL ADDRESS CELL PHONE NUMBER

This form is provided with:

II] Invitation to Bid l:] Request for Proposal / Qualifications D Proposal D Grantor Loan D Other

1. Has your business entity or any of your business entities’ partners, divisions, or any related business entity
previously performed work or provided goods or services to any City Department within the current or last fiscal year?
[x] ves L N

If yes, identify below the City Department that received the goods or services, the type(s) of goods or services previously
provided, and the amount received for the provision of such goods or services. (Use additional pages if necessary)

CITY DEPARTMENT TYPE OF GOODS/SERVICES AMOUNT RECEIVED
City of Margate Co-op Bid Coarse Aggregates $300,000

Miami Dade Water & Sewer Sand & Gravel $50,000

FL Keys Aqua Duct Water Plant Sludge Removal $500,000
Broward County School Bid Sand & Gravel $250,000

2. Has your business entity or any of your business entities’ partners, divisions, or any related business entity

previously applied for and received any grants or loans from any City Department within the current or last fiscal year?

‘:l Yes No

If yes, identify the City Department that awarded the grant or loan, the date such grant or loan was awarded, and the
amount of the grant or loan.

CITY DEPARTMENT DATE GRANT AWARDED AMOUNT OF GRANT OR LOAN




3. List below the name(s) and addrass(es) of all public officials with whom your business entity, or members of
your immediate family have a familial relationship. Identify the office the public official holds or the City Department for
which the public official works. (Attach additional sheets if necessary.)

NAME OF PUBLIC QFFICIALIEMPLOYEE ADDRESS CITY DEPARTMENT
N/A

4. List below the name(s) and address(es) of all family members of public officials with whom your business
entity, or members of your immediate family have a familial relationship. Identify the office the public official holds or
the City Department for which the public official works. (Attach additional sheets if necessary.)

NAME OF NAME OF PUBLIC OFFICIAL/ CITY DEPARTMENT
FAMILY MEMBER ADDRESS PUBLIC EMPLOYEE WHERE EMPLOYED
N/A

If you identified individuals in items one and / or two above, describe in detail below the direct benefit to be gained by the
public officials, and/or their family members as the result of the contract, proposal, request for proposal, invitation to bid,
or grant proposal. (Attach additional sheets if necessary.)

List below the name(s) and address(es) of all paid consultants and/or lobbyists utilized to used in preparation of , request
for proposal or qualifications, invitation to bid, or grant or loan proposal:

NAME QF PAID CONSULTANT/LOBBYIST ADORESS

List below the name(s) of any officer, director, or agent of the Business Entity who is also an employee of the City of
Delray Beach.

NAME OF OFFICER, DIRECTOR, OR AGENT WHQ IS ALSO AN EMPLOYEE OF THE CITY
N/A

List below the name(s) of any Public Official who owns, directly or indirectly, an interest of more than five percent (5%) in
the Business Entity or any of its parent company or subsidiaries.

NAME OF ANY PUBLIC OFFICIAL WHO OWNS INTEREST IN BUSINESS ENTITY
N/A




CITY OF DELRAY BEACH

Notification and Affidavit Pursuant to Fla. Stat. Section 287.133(2)(a)

Vendor Name: Austin Tupler Trucking Inc.
Vendor FEIN: 59-1426412
Vendor’s
Authorized
Representative
Name and Title: Glen Tupler
Address: 6570 SW47TH CT.
City: Davie State:_ FL Zip: 33314
Phone Number: (954) 583-0801
Email Address: Tupler@tuplertrucking.com

A person or affiliate who has been placed on the convicted vendor list following a conviction for a public
entity crime may not submit a bid, proposal, or reply on a contract to provide any goods or services
to a public entity; may not submit a bid, proposal, or reply on a contract with a public entity for
the construction or repair of a public building or public work; may not submit bids, proposals, or
replies on leases of real property to a public entity, may not be awarded or perform work as a
contractor, supplier, subcontractor, or consultant under a contract with any public entity; and may
not transact business with any public entity in excess of the threshold amount provided in s.
287.017 for CATEGORY TWO for a period of 36 months following the date of being placed on

the convicted vendor list. As the officer or representative of the company, I certify that the Proposer and
its affiliates:

1. Have been notified of the above provision,

2. are not on the convicted vendor list as provided by Florida Statute §287.133(2)(a); and

-

3. have not been on the convicted vendor list for a period of 36 months prior to submission of the bid,
proposal, or reply.

Under penalty ofperjury, I declare that I have read the foregoing document, and the facts stated in it are
true. (
\ v
Signature: &
(AuthoriZed Signature)
Print Name and Title _Glen Tupler President

Date: 03/03/2026




List below the name(s), titles and address(es) of all relatives of public officials of the City of Delray Beach having any direct
or indirect financial interest of 5% or more in the Business Entity (other than a relationship described in response to
paragraphs above), state to whom and how they are related, and describe the nature and extent of the financial interest.

NAME QOF ANY PUBLIC OFFICIAL'S RELATIVE WHO OWNS AN INTEREST OF 5% OR MORE IN BUSINESS ENTITY

Please check one of the following statements and attach additional documentation if necessary:

X To the best of my knowledge, the Business Entity has no potential conflict of interest due to any other clients,
contracts, or property interest.

The undersigned firm, by attachment to this form, submits information which may be a potential conflict of interest
due to other clients, contracts, or property interests.

By signing below, | certify under oath and penalty of perjury that all statements on or attached to this form are
true and correct to the best of my knowledge. | further understand that omissions shall be cause
for disqualification from participation in the proposed transaction.

> 03/03/2026
Signaturt\) Date
Glen Tupler President

Printed Name Title



Notification of Public Records Law Pertaining to Public Contracts and Requests
for Contractor Records Pursuant to Chapter 119, Florida Statutes

Pursuant to Chapter 119, Florida Statutes, Contractor shall comply with the public records law by keeping
and maintaining public records required by the City of Delray Beach in order to perform the service. Upon
request from the City of Delray Beach’ custodian of public records, contractor shall provide the City of
Delray Beach with a copy of the requested records or allow the records to be inspected or copied within
a reasonable time at a cost that does not exceed the cost provided in Chapter 119, Florida Statutes or as
otherwise provided by law. Contractor shall ensure that public records that are exempt or confidential
and exempt from public records disclosure requirements are not disclosed except as authorized by law
for the duration of the contract term and following completion of the contract If the Contractor does not
transfer the records to the City of Delray Beach. Contractor upon completion of the contract, shall
transfer, at no cost, to the City of Delray Beach all public records in possession of the Contractor or keep
and maintain public records required by the City of Delray Beach in order to perform the service. If the
Contractor transfers all public records to the City of Delray Beach upon completion of the contract, the
Contractor shall destroy any duplicate public records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from
public records disclosure requirements. If the Contractor keeps and maintains public records upon
completion of the contract, the Contractor shall meet all applicable requirements for retaining public
records. All records stored electronically must be provided to the City of Delray Beach, upon request from
the City of Delray Beach’S custodian of public records, in a format that is compatible with the information
technology systems of the City of Delray Beach.

IF THE SELECTED BIDDER/PROPOSER HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING
THE APPLICATION OF CHAPTER 119, FLORIDA STATUTES, TO THE
SELECTED BIDDER’S/PROPOSER’S DUTY TO PROVIDE PUBLIC
RECORDS RELATING TO THIS AGREEMENT, CONTACT THE
CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC RECORDS AT CITY OF DELRAY BEACH, CITY
CLERK, 100 N.W. 15T AVE., DELRAY BEACH FLORIDA. THE CITY
CLERK’S OFFICE MAY BE CONTACTED BY PHONE AT 561-243-7050
OR VIA EMAIL AT CITYCLERK@MYDELRAYBEACH.COM.

Acknowledged:

AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.

Signature \\)

Glen Tupler President
Name and Title {Print or Type)

03/03/2026
Date




DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE

AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC. is a drug-free workplace and has
(Company Name)
a substance abuse policy in accordance with and pursuant to Section 440.102, Florida Statutes.

Acknowledged by:

AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.

Firf&‘

Sign’atﬁse\}

Glen Tupler

Name and Title

03/03/2026

Date



NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
STATE OF Florida
COUNTY OF Broward

Before me, the undersigned authority, personally appeared Glen Tupler , who,
after being by me first duly sworn, deposes and says of authority’s personal knowledge that:

a. Glen Tupler is _ President of AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC., the
Bidder/Proposer that has submitted a Bid/Proposal to perform work for the following:
Solicitation No.: 2026-018 Title: Purchase of road construction materials

b. Glen Tupler _ is fully informed respecting the preparation and contents of the attached

solicitation, and of all pertinent circumstances respecting such solicitation.
Such Bid/Proposal is genuine and is not a collusive or sham Bid/Proposal.

o Neither the said Bidder/Proposer nor any of its officers, partners, owners, agents,
representatives, employees, or parties in interest, including this affiant, has in any way colluded,
conspired, connived, or agreed, directly or indirectly, with any other Bidder/Proposer, firm, or
person to submit a collusive or sham Bid/Proposal in connection with the solicitation and
contract for which the attached Bid/Proposal has been submitted or to refrain from proposing in
connection with such solicitation and contract, or has in any manner, directly or indirectly,
sought by agreement or collusion or communication or conference with any other
Bidder/Proposer, firm, or person to fix the price or prices in the attached Bid/Proposal or any
other Bidder/Proposer, or to fix any overhead, profit, or cost element of the Bid/Proposal price
or the Bid/Proposal price of any other Bidder/Proposer, or to secure through any collusion,
conspiracy, connivance, or unlawful agreement any advantage against the City or any person
interested in the proposed contract.

d. The price or prices quoted in the attached Bid/Proposal are fair and proper and are not tainted
by any collusion, conspiracy, connivance, or unlawful agreement on the part of the
Bidder/Proposer or any of its agents, representatives, owners, employees, or parties in interest,
including this-affiant.

Signature \)

STATE OF Florida

COUNTY OF _Broward
The foregoing instrument was subscribed to and sworn before me by means of (O physical
presence  or [ online notarization, this 3 = day of _March , 2026, by
Glen Tupler (name of person), as _President _ (type of authority)

for _AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC. (name of party on behalf of whom instrument was executed).

Personally known _x OR Produced Identification j
Type of Identification Produced ’Y

Notary P[ublic — State of

LIDICE DENIS CABRERA
MY COMMISSION # HH 323270

EXPIRES: October 18, 2026



TRUTH — IN — NEGOTIATION CERTIFICATE

The undersigned warrants (i) that it has not employed or retained any company or person, other than
bona fide employees working solely for the undersigned, to solicit or secure the Agreement and (ii) that
it has not paid or agreed to pay any person, company, corporation, individual, or firm other than its bona
fide employees working solely for the undersigned or agreed to pay any fee, commission, percentage, gift,
or any other consideration contingent upon or resulting from the award or making of the Agreement.

The undersigned certifies that the wage rates and other factual unit costs used to determine the

compensation provided for in the Agreement are accurate, complete, and current as of the date of the
Agreement.

Name: Glen Tupler

Title: President

Date: C /2026

Signature:




Scrutinized Company Certification

This certification is required pursuant to Florida State Statute Section 287.135.

A company, that at the time of bidding or submitting a proposal for a new contract or renewal of an
existing contract, is on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List or the Scrutinized
Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List is ineligible for, and may not bid on,
submit a proposal for, or enter into or renew a contract with an agency or local governmental entity for
goods or services of $S1 million or more.

Companies must complete and return this form with its response.
Company. AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC. FID or EIN No. 59-1426412
Address. 6570 SW 47TH CT.

city. Davie State. Florida zip. 33314

I, Glen Tupler , as a representative of AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING. INC

certify and affirm that this company is not on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List or

the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List or engaged in business

operations in Cuba or Syria.

President
Title

Sigriatu?e
N

Glen Tupler 03/03/2026
Printed Name Date




Vendor Name:
Vendor FEIN:

Vendor’s
Authorized
Representativ
e

Name and Title:

Address:

Phone Number:

Email Address:

CITY OF DELRAY BEACH
Affidavit Pursuant to Fla. Stat. Section 448.095

AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC,
_59-1426412
Glen Tupler President

6570 SW 47TH CT.

City: _Davie State:_ FL Zip: 33314

(954) 583 - 0801
Tupler@tuplertrucking.com

Florida Statute §448.095 states that a public agency must require in any contract that the
contractor, and any subcontractor thereof, register with and use the E-Verify system to verify the
work authorization status of all new employees of the contractor or subcontractor.

As the officer or representative of the company, I certify that the company identified above:

1. 1is registered with the E-Verify System.

2. uses the E-Verify system to verify the work authorization status of all new employees of the
contractor or subcontractor; and

~

3. If the Proposer enters into a contract with a subcontractor, the Proposer will require that the

subcontractor provide the contractor with an affidavit stating that the subcontractor does not
employ, contract with, or subcontract with an unauthorized alien. The contractor shall maintain
a copy of such affidavit for the duration of the contract.

Under penalties of perjury, I declare that I have read the foregoing documents and the facts
stated in it are true.

Signature:

(Authorﬁ@gnature)
Print Name and Title Glen Tupler President
Date: 03/03/2026




E-Verify

Company ID Number: 1631759

Approved by:

Employer
AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.

Name (Please Type or Print) Title
GLEN TUPLER President

Signature Date
Electronically Signed 01/21/2021
Department of Homeland Security - Verification Division

Name (Please Type or Print) itle
USCIS Verification Division

Signature Date
Electronically Signed 01/21/2021

Page 13 of 17 E-Verify MOU for Employers | Revision Date 06/01/13




E-Verify

Company ID Number: 1631759

Information Required for the E-Verify Program

information relating to your Company:

Company Name

AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.

Company Facility Address

6570 SW 47th Ct
DAVIE, FL 33314

Company Alternate Address

County or Parish BROWARD
Employer Identification Number 591426412
North American Industry P
Classification Systems Code

Parent Company

Number of Employees 20 to 99

Number of Sites Verified for

Page 14 of 17 E-Verify MOU for Employers | Revision Date 06/01/13




CITY OF DELRAY BEACH

Affidavit Pursuant to Fla. Stat. 287.133

Vendor Name: AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.
Vendor FEIN: 59-1426412
Vendor’s
Authorized
Representative
Name and Title: Glen Tupler President
Address: 6570 SW47TH CT.
City: _ Davie State:_Florida Zip:_33314

Phone Number: (954) 583 - 0801
Email Address:  Tupler@tuplertrucking.com

Pursuant to Florida Statute §287.135, Proposer is ineligible to enter into, or renew, this Agreement if Proposer
is on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List (as identified in Section 215.4725, Florida Statutes), or is
engaged in a boycott of Israel.

As the officer or representative of the company, I certify that the company identified above:

1.Is not on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List, and that Proposer is not engaged in a boycott of
Israel.

2.1f at any time during the Procurement Period or if selected, during the term of the Agreement with the City,
the Proposer is placed on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List, or is engaged in a boycott of
Israel, the Proposer/Contractor will notify the City in writing within ten (10) days of the date of such
occurrence.

3. Proposer understands that in the event the City determines, using credible information available to the public,
that Proposer has submitted a false certification or Proposer is found to have been placed on the Scrutinized
Companies that Boycott Israel List or engaged in a boycott of Israel, the City may, in its sole discretion,
terminate any Agreement entered into and seek a civil penalty, and other damages and relief, against
Proposer/Contractor, pursuant to Section 287.135, Florida Statutes. In addition, the City may pursue any and
all other legal remedies against Proposer/Contractor.

4. Proposer/Contractor will not seek damages, fees, or costs against the City in the event the City terminates an
Agreement pursuant to this provision.

Under penalties of perjury, I declare that I have read the foregoing documents and the facts stated in it are

true.
Signature:
(Authodzea‘%@mre)
Print Name and Title _Glen Tupler President

Date: 03/03/2026




CITY OF DELRAY BEACH

Affidavit Pursuant to Fla. Stat. Section 287.134

Vendor Name: AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.
Vendor FEIN: 59-1426412
Vendor’s
Authorized
Representative
Name and Title: Glen Tupler
Address: 6570 SW 47TH CT.
City: _Davie State: Florida Zip: 33314
Phone Number: (954) 583 - 0801
Email Address: Tupler@tuplertrucking.com

Pursuant to Section 287.134, Florida Statutes, an entity or affiliate who has been placed on the
discriminatory vendor list may not submit a bid, proposal, or reply on a contract to provide any goods or
services to a public entity; may not submit a bid, proposal, or reply on a contract with a public entity for the
construction or repair of a public building or public work; may not submit bids, proposals, or replies on
leases of real property to a public entity; may not be awarded or perform work as a contractor, supplier,
subcontractor, or consultant under a contract with any public entity; and may not transact business with any
public entity. By execution of this Agreement, Contractor represents that it has not been placed on the
discriminatory vendor list as provided in Section 287.134, Florida Statutes.

As the officer or representative of the company, I certify that the company identified above:

I. s not on the discriminatory vendor list as provided by Florida Statute §287.134

Under penalty of perj lare that I have read the foregoing document and the facts stated in it are
true.
\ 4
Signature:
(Autho;{}ed/Signanxre)
Print Name and Title Glen Tupler President

Date: 03/03/2026




CITY OF DELRAY BEACH

Affidavit Regarding the Use of Coercion for Labor and Services

Vendor Name: AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC
Vendor FEIN: 59-1426412
Vendor's
Authorized
szz:s::éa%\:; Glen Tupler President
Address: 6570 SW 47TH CT.
City: _Davie State: Florida  zip:_ 33314

Phone Number: (954) 583 - 0801
Email Address: Tupler@tuplertrucking.com

Florida Statute §787.06(13) requires all nongovernmental entities executing, renewing, or

extending a contract with a governmental entity to provide an affidavit signed by a officer or
representative of the nongovernmental entity under penalty of perjury that the nongovernmental
entity does not use coercion for labor or services as defined in that statute. The City of Delray
Beach, Florida is a governmental entity for the purposes of this statute.

As the officer or representative of the company, | certify that the company identified above

does not:

the facts stated inita

Use or threaten to use physical force against any person;

Restrain, isolate, or confine or threaten to restrain, isolate, or confine any person without
lawful authority and against his or her will;

Use lending or other credit methods to establish a debt by any person when labor or
services are pledged as a security for the debt, if the value of the labor or services as
reasonably assessed is not applied towards the liquidation of the debt, the length and
nature of the labor or services are not respectively limited and defined;

Destroy, conceal, remove, confiscate, withhold, or possess any actual or purported
passport, visa, or other immigration document, or any other actual or purported
government identification, of any person;

Cause or threaten to cause financial harm to any person;

Entice or lure any person by fraud or deceit;

Provide controlled substances as outlined in Schedule | or Schedule |l of Florida State

Statute §893.03 to any person for the purpose of exploitation of that person.

Under penalties o ‘declare that | have read the foregoing document and that

Signature:

\) (Authorized Signature)
Print Name .
and Title: Glen Tupler President

Date: 03/03/2026




CITY OF DELRAY BEACH
Affidavit Pursuant to Fla. Stat. 287.138

Vendor Name: AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC
Vendor FEIN: 59-1426412
Vendor’s
Authorized
Representative
Name and Title: Glen Tupler President
Address: 6570 SW 47TH CT.
City: _Davie State:_Florida Zip: 33314

Phone Number: (954) 583 - 0801
Email Address: Tupler@tuplertrucking.com

Florida Statute §287.138 requires all nongovernmental entities executing, renewing, or extending
a contract with a governmental entity to provide an affidavit signed by an officer or representative of the
nongovernmental entity under penalty of perjury that the nongovernmental entity does not meet any of
the criteria in paragraphs (2)(a)-(c) of the statute. The City of Delray Beach, Florida is a governmental
entity for the purposes of this statute.

As the officer or representative of the company, I certify under penalty of perjury that the company
identified above:

1. isnot owned by the government of a foreign country of concern;

2. the government of a foreign country of concern does not have a controlling interest in the company;
and

3. The company is not organized under the laws of and does not have its principal place of business in

a foreign country cern.
(\
Signature:
(Authorized $ignature)
Print Name and Title __Glen Tupler President

Date: 03/03/2026




CITY OF DELRAY BEACH

Affidavit Pursuant to Fla. Stat. Section 286.101(3)

Vendor Name: AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC
Vendor FEIN: 59-1426412

Vendor’s
Authorized
Representative

Name and Title: Glen T Ipler President

Address: 6570 SW 47TH CT.

City: _Davie State:_Florida Zip: 33314
Phone Number: (954) 583 - 0801
Email Address: Tupler@tuplertrucking.com

Any entity that applies to a state agency or political subdivision for a grant or proposes a contract having a value of
$100,000 or more shall disclose to the state agency or political subdivision any current or prior interest of, any contract
with, or any grant or gift received from a foreign country of concern if such interest, contract, or grant or gift has a value
of $50,000 or more and such interest existed at any time or such contract or grant or gift was received or in force at any
time during the previous 5 years. Such disclosure shall include the name and mailing address of the disclosing entity, the
amount of the contract or grant or gift or the value of the interest disclosed, the applicable foreign country of concern and,
if applicable, the date of termination of the contract or interest, the date of receipt of the grant or gift, and the name of the
agent or controlled entity that is the source or interest holder. Within 1 year before applying for any grant or proposing
any contract, such entity must provide a copy of such disclosure to the Department of Financial Services. As the officer or
representative of the company, [ certify that the Proposer and its affiliates:

Under penalty of pe{': ry'\

1. does NOT have any current or prior interest of, any contract with, or any grant or gift received from a foreign
country of concern if such interest, contract, or grant or gift has a value of $50,000 or more; and

2. has Not had prior interest of, any contract with, or any grant or gift received from a foreign country of concern
within the past 5 years.

OR
3. Has provided disclosure to the City including the name and mailing address of the disclosing entity, the
amount of the contract or grant or gift or the value of the interest disclosed, the applicable foreign country of

concern and, if applicable, the date of termination of the contract or interest, the date of receipt of the grant or gift,
and the name of the agent or controlled entity that is the source or interest holder; and

4. Has provided a copy of such disclosure to the Department of Financial Services within one year before proposing
any grant or contract.

L]

eclare that I have read the foregoing document, and the facts stated in it are true.

Signature: =

(AuthoriZed Signature)
Print Name and Title  Glen Tupler President
Date: 03/03/2026




REFERENCES
Entity Name: City of Sunrise

Entity’s Primary Contact for contract (Name & Title): Holly Raphackson Contracts
Administrator

Phone Number: (954) 572-2274

Email Address: Hwaphaelson@sunrisefl.gov
Project Term (Start/End Date): On-going
Types of Work: Water Plant Services

Beginning and ending contract/PO amounts: 2025-2029 $499,000

Entity Name: Margate Co-Op Bid

Entity’s Primary Contact for contract (Name & Title): Spencer Shambray, Purchasing
Director

Phone Number: (954) 321-0505

Email Address: Purchase@margatefl.com
Project Term (Start/End Date): On-going
Types of Work: Sand & Gravel delivery

Beginning and ending contract/PO amounts: On-going $300,000

Entity Name: Town of Davie

Entity’s Primary Contact for contract (Name & Title): Neil Buckeridge, Utilities
Superintendent

Phone Number: (954) 797 - 1000

Email Address: Procurement@davie-fl.gov
Project Term (Start/End Date): On-going
Types of Work: Sand & Gavel

Beginning and ending contract/PO amounts: On-going $100,000
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BROWARD COUNTY LOCAL BUSINESS TAX RECEIPT

115 S. Andrews Ave., Rm. A-100. Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33301-1895 — 954-357-4829
VALID OCTOBER 1, 2025 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30,2026

i :379-2732
Rece'pt #'ALL OTHERS (TRANSPORTATION

Business Name: AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING INC Business Type:BROKER)
Owner Name: AUSTIN W TUPLER Business Opened:08/09/1972
Business Location: 6570 sw 47 CT State/County/Cert/Reg:
DAVIE Exemption Code:

Business Phone: 954-583-0801

Rooms Seats Employees Machines Professionals

For Vending Business Only
Number of Machines: Vending Type: ~
Tax Amount ‘ Transfer Fee ‘ NSF Fee ' Penalty ( Prior Years I Collection Cost Total Paid
45.00] o.ooL 0.00 o.ooL o.ool 0.00 45.00
Re ceipt Fee R B o 45.00 T
Packing/Processing/Canning Employees 0.00

THIS RECEIPT MUST BE POSTED CONSPICUOUSLY IN YOUR PLACE OF BUSINESS

THIS BECOMES A TAX RECEIPT This tax is levied for the privilege of doing business within Broward County and is
non-regulatory in nature. You must meet all County and/or Municipality planning
WHEN VALIDATED and zoning requirements. This Business Tax Receipt must be transferred when

the business is sold, business name has changed or you have moved the
business location. This receipt does not indicate that the business s legal or that
itis in compliance with State or local laws and regulations.

Mailing Address:

AUSTIN W TUPLER ' Receipt #13B-24-00006396
6570 SW 47 CT Paid 07/18/2025 45.00
DAVIE, FL 33314

2025 - 2026



STATE OF FLORIDAGS

DEPARTMENT OF STATE

I, RICHARD (DICK) STONE, Secretary of State of the State of Florida, do hereby

certify that thé following is a true and correct copy of

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

OF

| ‘ v AUSTIN TUPLER TRUCKING, INC.
; S | ! ' ' -

a corporation organized and existing under the Laws of the State of Florida, filed on

the 9tlday of August A.D., 19 72 as shown by the records of

this office.

GIVEN under my hand and the Great
Seal of the State of Florida, at
: Tallahassee, -thé Capital, this the

9th day of August,

A.D., 1972-(b L‘A) [

SECRETARY OF STATE

corp—88
3-29-72

Con Sw 6" ;utﬂ”’ ggz’{:\éi7

L]
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ACORD
A

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
02/24/2026

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER

CONTACT
NAME: Judy Chance

) : PHONE E FAX
King Risk Partners, LLC (AIC. No, Exty; (888) 377-0420 (AIC, No):
643 SW 4th Ave Suite 210 L s:  Judy.chance@king-insurance.com
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Gainesville FL 32601 INSURER A : Ascendant Commercial Insurance, Inc 19683
INSURED INSURER B :
Austin Tupler Trucking, Inc. INSURER C :
6570 SW 47th Court NSURERD :
INSURERE :
Davie FL 33314 INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:  CL258691280 REVISION NUMBER:
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
INSR ADDL[SUBR] POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WVD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE R
DAMAGE TO RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) $
MED EXP (Any ane person) 3
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE 3
poLICY s Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OPAGG | $
OTHER: 3
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY (Ea accidont) s 1,000,000
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) $
OWNED SCHEDULED 4 CA- g "
A OMNED iy - SCHED CA-61501-2 08/08/2025 | 08/08/2026 | BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | §
S<| HIRED S| NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)
> PIP-Basic s 10,000
UMBRELLALIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE 5
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE 3
DED L ] RETENTION § $
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER 1 OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY " STATUTE ER
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? D N/A
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EAEMPLOYEE | §
If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE- POLICYLIMIT |

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule,

may be attached if more space is required)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

City of Delray Beach
100 NW 1st Street
Delray Beach, FL 33444

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Willian,

Cormdsbetey, Jr.

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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ACORD
V

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
2/24/2026

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER

Acrisure South Insurance Services, LLC
1317 Citizens Blvd

Leesburg FL 34748

NaME: | Certificate Dept

PHONE ey 954-755-8577 | AR oy

E-MAIL .
ADDRESs: certs@satlanticins.com

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
License#: L122365] INSURER A : Imperium Insurance Company 35408
I/N\sLlJJRS?IN TUPLER TRUCKING INC AUSTTUP-02) \\surer 8 : Progressive .Express Insurance Company 10193
6570 Sw 47th Court INSURER ¢ : Upland Specialty Insurance Company 16988
Davie FL 33314 INSURER D : GuideOne National Insurance Company 14167
INSURERE :
INSURER F :

COVERAGES

CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 214308175

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADDL[SUBR POLICY EFF_| POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE ] ) POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY MNG-IIC-GL-0001216-03 10/27/2025 10/27/2026 | EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
i X | DAMAGE TO RENTED
| CLAIMS-MADE | OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) $ 100,000
MED EXP (Any one person) $ 5,000
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | $ 1,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
X | poLicy D B Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | § 2,000,000
OTHER: $
B | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY 03277670 2242026 | 2/24/2027 | GOMBINED SINGLELIMIT 1 5 1,000,000
ANY AUTO | BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
OWNED SCHEDULED .
AUTOS ONLY X AUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per accident)| $
HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)
PIP-BASIC $ 10,000
C | X | UMBRELLALIAB X OCCUR USXTL1233326 2/24/2026 2/24/2027 | EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE $ 1,000,000
1
DED | { RETENTION $ $
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY - Starure | ER
ANYPROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT $
OFFICER/MEMBEREXCLUDED? D N/A
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| §
If yes, describe under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | §
O | POLLUTION DENVP00000887-00 1/29/2026 1/29/2027 | DED. $2,500 EACHOCCUR 1,000,000
AGGREGATE 2,000,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)
SCOPE OF BUSINESS: HAULING SAND AND GRAVEL FOR HIRE

1994 KENWORTH DUMP TRUCK VIN#: 1XKADR9X1RS611125
2013 ASPT DUMP TRUCK VIN#:FLA66917111111111

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

City of Delray Beach
100 NW 1st Street
Delray Beach, FL 33444

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
-t

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
02/25/2026

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS

CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND,

EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES

BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PR\(/)I_JUtiERB ¢ Lie el Colleen DeWitt
ioletBerri, E TFAX
1475 S Price Rd, E;A*}SNEO e (800) 409-8958 | (A/C, Noy:
Chandler, AZ 85286 bEss: certs@vensure. com
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
INSURERA: Midwest Employers Casualty Company 23612
INSURED .
Harbor America Holdings, Inc. R
L/C/F Austin Tupler Trucking, Inc. INSURERC ;
1475 S. Price Road INSURERD :
Chandler AZ 85286 INSURERE :
INSURER F :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 10246239

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADDL[SUBR| POLICY EFF | POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WVD POLICY NUMBER (MM/DD/YYYY) | (MM/DD/YYYY) LIMITS
COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY | EACH OCCURRENCE 3
f |"DAMAGE TO RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE | OCCUR 1 PREMISES (Ea occurrence) | $
| MED EXP (Any one person) $
| PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | '§
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $
[ T
poLICY 5?87 | jtoc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $
| OTHER: $
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY EMBIED S NOLELIMIT T g
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
OWNED I SCHEDULED ;
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per accident)| $
HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)
$
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE S
EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE AGGREGATE
T T
DED | | RETENTIONS
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER [ OTH-

A |AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY Y/N KEYPE00QQ002502 09/09/2025 109/09/2026 \/I STATUTE I | ER
ANYPROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE [ E.L. EACH ACCIDENT s 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? N/A
(Mandatory in NH) | E.L. DISEASE-EAEMPLOYEE| § 1,000,000
If yes, describe under |
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below | E.L. DISEASE-POLICYLIMIT | § 1,000,000

i |

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)
Coverage provided for all leased employees but not subcontractors of: Austin Tupler Trucking, Inc.

Client Effective: ©01/01/2025.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

FL - Florida

City of Delray Beach
100 NW 1st Street
Delray Beach, FL 33444

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Daniel Opferman
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