City of Delray Beach

Sod Materials

BID No. 2016-053

GRELITE CORP MULLINGS ENGINEERING SERVICES, LLC ODOMS' SOD, INC.
Item Description Estimated Quantity Unit Price Pallet Price Roll Price Unit Price Pallet Price Roll Price Unit Price Pallet Price Roll Price

1 Celebration Bermuda 55,000 Sq. Ft. 062 $ 310.00 155.00 | $ 0.40 S 160.00 $ 100.00 No Bid $ 0.48 S 0.46

2 Tifeagle Bermuda 10,000 Sq. Ft. 062 $ 310.00 155.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Tifway 419 Bermuda 10,000 Sq. Ft. 298 S 1,490.00 745.00 | $ 039 S 156.00 $ 96.00 No Bid $ 0.53 S 0.58

4 St. Augustine 30,000 Sq. Ft. 050 $ 250.00 125.00 | $ 035 S 175.00 No Bid| $ 0.34 No Bid No Bid

5 Bahia 20,000 Sq. Ft. 040 $ 180.00 90.00 | $ 025 S 100.00 $ 52.00 | $ 0.24 No Bid No Bid
*Pricing $0.44 thru 0.81 varies on the type

6 Removal & Installation 024 $ 0.24 0.24|$ 020 $ 10000 $ 50.00 of sod

*See submittal response for additional
comments

*See Attachment "A" for additional
comments

BID OPENING: 01/19/2016 @ 2:00 P.M.

POSTED: 01/20/2016




