#### NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

BID ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, MCSD No. 21-0053-MR

CONTRACT PERIOD: SEPTEMBER 1, 2020 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2023

BOARD APPROVED ON AUGUST 25, 2020

CONTRACT PERIOD: SEPTEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2024

BOARD APPROVED ON AUGUST 25, 2020

CONTRACT PERIOD: SEPTEMBER 1, 2024 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2025

**BOARD APPROVED ON AUGUST 25, 2020** 

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2020			
	ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT		
BIDDERS:	Catalog Name	Number	Discount
	SRP Components	2020	5%
	SportsPlay	2018	5%
	Superior Recreation	2019 (1)	5%
	Athletic Connection	2020	5%
	Bison	2020-21	5%
	Jaypro	2019-2020 (2)	5%
&B Management Group, Inc. dba Southern Park and Play Systems	Hadar Athletic	2014	5%
	Playcraft Systems	1	2%
	R3/Grounds for Play	2	2%
	UltraPlay	3	2%
	Id Sculpture	4	2%
	Childforms	5	2%
	Playtopia	6	2%
	Freenotes Harmony	7	2%
	SRP Parts	9	2%
	SportsPlay	10	2%
Advanced Recreational Concepts	Dynamo	20	2%
Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Play and Park Structures	44	10%
	Big Toys	33	5%
	UltraPlay	X	5%
	Freenotes Harmony	19	5%
	Snug Play	X	5%
	Sportsplay	X	5%
	Elephant Play	X	5%
	Adventurous Child	X	1%
	AAA State of Play	X	1%
	Cemrock	X	5%
	Everlast Climbing	X	5%
	Jensen Swing	X	5%
	Action Play System	Х	5%
	Forte Products	Х	5%
	Store.blissproducts.com	X	5%
	Dynacushion	Х	5%
	Superior Play	Х	5%
	World OF Wow	X	5%
	Waterworks International	X	5%
	Compac Water Play	X	5%
Bliss Products and Services, Inc.			
Creative Shade Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ndustrial Shadeports, Inc.	Industrial Shadeports	2020	10%
Kompan, Inc.	Kompan US Price List		9%

BIDDERS:		ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT		
	Catalog Name	Number	Discount	
	SRP - Superior Play	2020	5%	
	SRP - Superior Play Components	2020	5%	
	SRP - Grounds for Play	2020	5%	
	SRP - Freenotes Harmony Park	2020	5%	
	Big Toys	2020	5%	
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat	Dynamo	2020	5%	
AeTEOR Education, LLC	Kidstuff Playsystems	1005	ADD 34% (15)	
	Miracle Recreation Equipment			
	Company	2020	8% (21)	
			12% (21)	
			15% (21)	
			18% (21)	
			20% (21)	
	Bleachers		10% (22)	
	UPC Parks		5%	
Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc./Miracle Recreation Equi	pment, CO Action Play Systems		5%	
PlayCore Wisconsin DBA Game Time	Game Time	2020	10%	
	(B) Pro-Tech Surfacing		3%	
	(B) Cre8 Play		3%	
	Playworld	2020	5%	
laymore West, Inc.	Berliner	2020	3%	
	Playcraft Systems	1	Install Only	
	R3/Grounds for Play	2	Install Only	
	UltraPlay	3	Install Only	
	Id Sculpture	4	Install Only	
	Childforms	5	Install Only	
	Playtopia	6	Install Only	
	Freenotes Harmony	7	Install Only	
	SRP Parts	8	Install Only	
	Sports Play	10	Install Only	
Playspace Services, Inc.	Dynamo	20	Install Only	
Playpower LT Farmington, Inc.	Little Tikes Commercial Little Tikes Commercial	2020 2020	25% (25)(26) 5% (26)(27)	

		ITEM 1: PLAYGROUND EQUIPMEN	[
BIDDERS:	Catalog Name	Number	Discount
	Jambette	2019 - 20	4%
	Play Ground Equipment.com	Volume 2	10%
Project Innovations, Inc.	Kids Pro Surf Turf & Play Pad	Project Innovations	5%
Rep Services. Inc.	Landscape Structures, Inc.		3%
	Adventure Playground Systems	Playground & Park Design	3%
	Kidstuff Playsystem	Catalog # 1005	3%
	Childforms	Volume 12	3%
Superior Park Systems, Inc. (A)	Childforms	Sales Brochure	3%
			<b>60</b> /
	Henderson Recreation	2020 Price List	6%
Swartz Associates, Inc.	Action Play Systems	2020 Price List	10%
Fop Line Recreation, Inc.	BCI Burke	01	5%
1 /			
Varsity Sports dba BSN Sports, LLC (42)	BSN Sports Equipment	20-57307	10%

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2020

		ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT	
BIDDERS:	Catalog Name	Number	Discount
	Pilot Rock	260 - 2019	5%
	Ultra Site	2020	5%
	Ultra Play	2020	5%
	Polly Products	2019	5%
	Stern Williams	2020	5%
&B Management Group, Inc. dba Southern Park and Play Systems	Superior Site Amenities	2020	5%
	Ultrasite	11	2%
	SRP Amenities	12	2%
	Paris Fitness and Amenities	13	2%
	ActionFit	14	3%
	Bison	15	3%
	The Park Catalog	theparkcatalog.com	2%
	JayPro	16	3%
	NRS Bleachers	19	3%
dvanced Recreational Concepts	Kay Park	21	2%
pollo Sunguard Systems, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Ultrasite	33	5%
	Superior		5%
	Jayhawk Plastics/Frog Furnishings		5%
	Doty & Sons Concrete Products		5%
	Crimson Poolside		5%
	Action Fit		5%
	Bark Park		5%
	Evertlast Climbing	х	5%
	Sportsfield Specialties	x	5%
	National Recreation Systems	X	5%
	Dero	X	5%
	Jaypro	X	5%
	Athletic Connections	X	5%
	GT Grandstand	X	5%
	Murdock Fountains	X	5%
	Murdock Fountains Most Dependable Fountains	X	5% 5%
	-	X	5% 5%
	Kings River Castings		
	Webcoat	X	5%
	Store.blissproducts.com	X	5%
	Colorado Time Systems	X	5%
	Spectrum Aquatics	X	5%
	Gared Sports	X	5%
	Power Systems	X	5%
	Stewart Tennis	X	5%
lice Due duete and Complete Las	US Tennis	Х	5%
liss Products and Services, Inc.			
reative Shade Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
idustrial Shadeports, Inc.	Industrial Shadeports	2020	10%
ompan, Inc.	TPP Price List		5%

		ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT	
BIDDERS:	Catalog Name	Number	Discount
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat	SRP - Superior Amenities	2020	5%
MeTEOR Education, LLC	Kidstuff Playsystems	1005	ADD 34% (15)
	Miracle Recreation Equipment Company	2020	5%
	Douglas Industries		5%
	Bison Sports		5%
	Kay Park		5%
	Wabash Valley		5%
	Foresite Designs		5%
	Murdock Fountains		5%
	Most Dependable Fountains		5%
	RCP Shelters		5%
	Coverworx Shelters		5%
Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc./Miracle Recreation Equipmen	, CO DogiPot (Pet Stations)		5%
	GT Site	2020	5%
PlayCore Wisconsin DBA Game Time	Ultra Site	2020	5%
	(B) Premier Polysteel		5%
	(B) ExoFit		5%
	Exofit (43)		5%
Playmore West, Inc.	Wabash Valley	2020	5%
	Ultrasite	11	Install Only
	SRP Amenities	12	Install Only
	Paris Fitness and Amenities	13	Install Only
	ActionFit	14	Install Only
	Bison	15	Install Only
	The Park Catalog	theparkcatalog.com	Install Only
	JayPro	16	Install Only
	NRS Bleachers	19	Install Only
Playspace Services, Inc.	Kay Park	21	Install Only
Playpower LT Farmington, Inc.	Little Tikes Commercial	2020 (29)	5% (30)

		ITEM 2: SITE EQUIPMENT	
BIDDERS:	Catalog Name	Number	Discount
	Play Ground Equipment.com	Volume 2	10%
Project Innovations, Inc.	Frog Furnishings	2018	3%
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
Rep Services. Inc.	DuMor Site Furnishings		3%
	Superior Amenities	2020 Catalog	2%
	Kay Park Recreation	2020 Catalog	2%
Superior Park Systems, Inc. (A)	Adventure Site Amenities	Playground & Park Design Guide	2%
	Sitescapes, Inc.	2020 Price List	5%
	Kay Park Recreation	2020	6%
	Ultra Site	2020 Price List	8%
	Frog Furnishings	2020 Price List	8%
	Vista Furnishings	2020 Price List	5%
	Superior Site Amenities	2020 Price List	8%
	Blue Valley Industries	2020 Price List	5%
	Jaypro Sports	2020	7%
	National Recreation Systems	2020 Price List	6%
Swartz Associates, Inc.	MyTCoat	2020 Price List	8%
Fop Line Recreation, Inc.	Premier Polysteel	02	3%
Varsity Sports dba BSN Sports, LLC (42)	BSN Sports Equipment	20-57307	10%

BIDDERS:		<b>ITEM 3: SHADE STRUCTURE</b>	
	Catalog Name	Number	Discount
	Fiberbuilt	2019	5%
	Superior Shade	Volume 11	5%
A&B Management Group, Inc. dba Southern Park and Play Systems	SkySpan	2020	5%
	SRP Shade	17	5%
	Ultra Shade	18	5%
	Ball Fabrics	ballfabrics.com	1%
	ICON Shelters	22	5%
	Cedar Forest Products	23	5%
	RCP Shelter	24	5%
Advanced Recreational Concepts	SRP Shelter	25	5%
Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc.	Apollo Sunguard	2019	8% (6)
	Shade Systems		5%
	Shade America		5%
	Ultra Shade		5%
	Ultra Shelter		5%
	Cedar Forest		5%
	USA Shade		5%
	Superior		5%
	Discounmt Awnings	Х	5%
	Accent Awnings	Х	5%
	Creative Shade	Х	5%
	Apollo Sunguard	Х	5%
	Play and Park Structures	Х	5%
Bliss Products and Services, Inc.	Americana Building	Х	5%
Creative Shade Solutions	Creative Shade (10)	1	15%
ndustrial Shadeports, Inc.	Industrial Shadeports	2020	10%
Kompan, Inc.	TPP Price List		4%

		ITEM 3: SHADE STRUCTURE	
BIDDERS:	Catalog Name	Number	Discount
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat	SRP - Superior Amenities	2020	5%
·			
MeTEOR Education, LLC	Kidstuff Playsystems	1005	ADD 34% (15)
Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc./Miracle Recreation Equipment, CO	USA Shade	2020	5%
unier reereation Equipment & Design, mes vindete reereation Equipment, CO	USA Shade	2020	370
PlayCore Wisconsin DBA Game Time	GT Shade	2018 / 2020	5%
	(B) Americana Outdoors		3%
	USA Shade	2020	3%
	Shade Systems	2020	3%
	Apollo Sunguard	2020	3%
Playmore West, Inc.	Superior Shelters	2020	3%
	SRP Shade	17	Install Only
	Ultrashade	18	Install Only
	Ball Fabrics	ballfabrics.com	Install Only
	ICON Shelters	22	Install Only
	Cedar Forest Products	23	Install Only
	RCP Shelter	24	Install Only
Playspace Services, Inc.	SRP Shelter	25	Install Only
Playpower LT Farmington, Inc.	Little Tikes Commercial	2020 (31)	5% (32)

		<b>ITEM 3: SHADE STRUCTURE</b>	
BIDDERS:	Catalog Name	Number	Discount
Project Innovations, Inc.	Pro Shade	Project Innovations, Inc.	3%
	SkyWays Shades		3%
	USA Shade		3%
Rep Services. Inc.	Porter Corp		3%
	Shade Systems, Inc.	Product Catalog	3%
Superior Park Systems, Inc. (A)	Adventure Shade Structures	Playground & Park Design Guide	3%
	Ultra Shade	2020 D 1 1 1	407
Security Association Inc. (27)		2020 Price List	4% 4%
Swartz Associates, Inc. (37)	Ultra Shelter	2020 Price List	4%
	Shade System, Inc.	03	5%
Fop Line Recreation, Inc.	Americana	04	5%
Varsity Sports dba BSN Sports, LLC	<b>BSN Sports Equipment</b>	20-57307	10%

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2020				
	ITEM 4: SURFACING MATERIALS			
BIDDERS:	Catalog Name	Number	Discount	
&B Management Group, Inc. dba Southern Park and Play Systems	Garick	2020-21 Quotation	5%	
	Rubber Designs	8	5% (3)	
advanced Recreational Concepts	Playspace ADA Wood Mulch	per regional supplier	5% (4)	
pollo Sunguard Systems, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Safety 1st		5%	
	Wood Mulch Products		5%	
	Xgrass		5%	
	Zeager		5%	
	Fibar		5%	
	East Coast Mulch		5%	
	IMC Outdoor		5%	
	Rubber Recycle	х	5%	
	OTS	X	5%	
	Forever Lawn	X	5%	
	Tot Turf	x	5%	
	Forestry Resources	X	5%	
	Kemfer Sawmill	X	5%	
	Express Mulch Blowing	X	5%	
	American Mulch	X	5%	
	Rubber Surfacing Specialists	X	5%	
	Choppers Shady Surfacing	X X	5%	
Bliss Products and Services, Inc.	Shady Surfacing		5%	
hiss flouters and services, nic.	Store.blissproducts.com	X	5%	
Creative Shade Solutions	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	No Biu	NU DIU	No bid	
ndustrial Shadeports, Inc.	Industrial Shadeports	2020	10%	
	Fibar EWF		4%	
	Turf Surfacing		4%	
	PIP Surfacing		4%	
	Rubber Safety Tiles		4%	
Compan, Inc.	Rubber Mulch		4%	

		ITEM 4: SURFACING MATERIAI	S
BIDDERS:	Catalog Name	Number	Discount
anier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat	Outdoor Safety Surfacing		5%
	outdoor builty burneing		070
IeTEOR Education, LLC	Kidstuff Playsystems	1005	ADD 34% (15)
	Rubber Recycle (Shredded Rubber)		5%
	Fibar Systems (EWF)		5%
	Forever Lawn (Artificial Turf)		5%
	NoFault (Poured in Place Surfacing)		5%
liller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc./Miracle Recreation Equipment, CC	Durable Lawn (Artificial Turf)		5%
layCore Wisconsin DBA Game Time	GT Impax	2020	5%
	Robertson TOT Turf		3%
	No Fault		3%
	X Grass		3%
	Forever Lawn		3%
	Mulch & Soil, Co.		3%
Playmore West, Inc.	Zeager		3%
	Rubber Designs	8	5% (24)
layspace Services, Inc.	Playspace ADA Wood Mulch	Per Regional Supplier	5% (25)
			()
Playpower LT Farmington, Inc.	No Fault	N/A	5% (33)

BIDDERS:		ITEM 4: SURFACING MATERIALS		
	Catalog Name	Number	Discount	
Project Innovations, Inc.	Kids Pro Surf Turf & Play Pad	Project Innovations, Inc.	5%	
	Forever Lawn VitriTurf		3%	
	Vitri Lurf No Fault Sports Group		3% 3%	
	iMulch		3%	
Rep Services. Inc.	Irvine		3%	
1				
	Forever Lawn	Product Catalog	3%	
Superior Park Systems, Inc. (A)	Forever Lawn	Playground Grass	3%	
	Foresty Resources	2020 Price List	10%	
	Cowart & Mulch	2020 Price List	10%	
	IMC Outdoor	2020 Price List	6%	
Swartz Associates, Inc.	Pierecton Rubber Products	2020 Price List	5%	
Top Line Recreation, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Varsity Sports dba BSN Sports, LLC (42)	BSN Sports Equipment	20-57307	10%	

	ITEM 5: INSTALLATION OF PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, SITE EQUIPMENT, SHADE STRUCTURE AND SURFACING MATRERIAL		
BIDDERS:	Installer/Sub Contractor Name	Percentage Mark up	
A&B Management Group, Inc. dba Southern Park and Play Systems	Ultimate Attitude, LLC	30% 20%	
acts Management Group, nic. doa Southern Fark and Flay Systems	Southern Park and Play Systems Playspace Services - playgrounds	37%	
	••• •••	37% 49%	
	Playspace Services - Shade Install		
	Playspace Services - Site Furnishings	75%	
advanced Recreational Concepts	Playspace Services - Safety Surfacing	*(5)	
duvanced Recreational Concepts	Playspace Services - Shelters Cocozza Construction & Consulting	69%	
	8	75% 75%	
	Dragon Recreation Services		
pollo Sunguard Systems, Inc.	Someson Homes	75% 75%	
spono Sunguard Systems, mc.	The Best of Southwest Framing		
	Bliss Products	50% (7)(8)	
	Shady Surfacing	50% (7)(8)	
	Jammin Playgrounds	50% (7)(8)	
	Complete Construction	50% (7)(8)	
Bliss Products and Services. Inc.	Premier Recreation	50% (7)(8)	
Sliss Products and Services, Inc.	Stewart Tennis	50% (7)(8)	
Creative Shade Solutions	Crusting Shade (10)	F00/ (11)	
Active Shade Soldhold	Creative Shade (10)	50% (11)	
ndustrial Shadeports, Inc.	Industrial Shadeports	130% (41)	
Industrial Shadeports, Inc.	Industrial Shadeports	130% (41)	
Kompan, Inc.	Precision Playgrounds, Inc.	30% - 100% (12)(13)	

	ITEM 5: INSTALLATION OF PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, SITE EQUIPMENT, SHADE STRUCTURE AND SURFAC MATRERIAL		
BIDDERS:	Installer/Sub Contractor Name	Percentage Mark up	
anier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat	Lanier Plans, Inc. dba KorKat	35%	
	Kidstuff Playsystems - Play Equipment	50% (16) (19)	
	Kidstuff Playsystems - Safety Surfacing	60% (16) (17) (19)	
feTEOR Education, LLC	Kidstuff Playsystems - Shade Structures	100% (18) (19)	
filler Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc./Miracle Recreation Equipment, CO	Ryan's Maintenance	27%	
	John Fitzgerald, Inc.	No Bid	
	Playground Equipment	30%	
	Site Amenities	30%	
ayCore Wisconsin DBA Game Time	Shade	30%	
	Playmore West, Inc Playground Equipment	32%	
	Playmore West, Inc Site Equipment	32%	
	Playmore West, Inc Site Equipment (43)	35%	
	Playmore West, Inc Shade Structures	180%	
aymore West, Inc.	Playmore West, Inc Surfacing (23)	100%	
	Playspace Services - Playgrounds	37%	
	Playspace Services - Shade Install	49%	
	Playspace Services - Site Furnishing	75%	
	Playspace Services - Safety Surfacing	*(26)	
ayspace Services, Inc.	Playspace Services - Shelters	69%	
	Playworx Playsets LLC - Playground and Playground Parts	47% (34)	
	Playworx Playsets LLC - Site Amenities	35%	
	Playworx Playsets LLC - Shade	100%	
laypower LT Farmington, Inc.	No Fault - Pour in Place Surface (34)	25%	

	ITEM 5: INSTALLATION OF PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT, SITE EQUIPMENT, SHADE STRUCTURE AND SURFACE MATRERIAL		
BIDDERS:	Installer/Sub Contractor Name	Percentage Mark up	
	Project Innovations-Playground Equipment	38%	
	Project Innovations-Pro Shades	80%	
	Project Innovations-Kids Pro Suft Turf & Play Pad	*(35)	
Project Innovations, Inc. (36)	Project Innovations-Frog Furnishings	60%	
	Johnny Pitts Construction	85%	
Rep Services. Inc.	Al Bosgraaf and Sons, Inc.	85%	
	FFG Development and Construction	100%	
	Sports Systems International, Inc.	100%	
	Hurley Construction	100%	
	Superior Park Systems, Inc.	100%	
	Easygreens	100%	
Superior Park Systems, Inc. (A)	Forever lawn	100%	
	Kennico, Inc.	34% - 110% (38)(39)	
Swartz Associates, Inc.	Rida Group Construction	34% - 110% (38)(39)	
	Hurley Construction, Inc.	36%	
Fop Line Recreation, Inc.	Al Bosgraaf & Sons, Inc.	36%	
Varsity Sports dba BSN Sports, LLC (42)	No Bid	No Bid	

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2020			
BIDDERS:	ITEM 6: REPAIRS HOURLY RATE- PER HOUR	ITEM 7: PERCENTAGE MARK UP FOR REPAIR MATERIAL	
A&B Management Group, Inc. dba Southern Park and Play Systems	\$150.00	No Bid	Digital Catalogs
Advanced Recreational Concepts	\$197.50	30%	Digital Catalogs
Apollo Sunguard Systems, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	Digital Catalogs
Bliss Products and Services, Inc.	\$250.00 (9)	25% (9)	Printed Catalogs
Creative Shade Solutions	\$125.00	10%	Digital Catalogs Printed Catalogs
Industrial Shadeports, Inc.	\$265.00	15%	Digital Catalog
			Digital Catalog
Kompan, Inc.	\$200.00	*(14)	Printed Catalogs

TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT	, MCSD No. 21-0053-MR		
Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2020			
BIDDERS:	ITEM 6: REPAIRS HOURLY RATE- PER HOUR	ITEM 7: PERCENTAGE MARK UP FOR REPAIR MATERIAL	
Lanier Plans, Inc. dba Korkat	\$75.00	35%	Digital Catalog
	975,00		Digital Catalog
MeTEOR Education, LLC	\$75.00 (20)	20% (20)	Digital price list/ No catalog
Miller Recreation Equipment & Design, Inc./Miracle Recreation Equipment, CO	\$150.00	0%	No Catalog
PlayCore Wisconsin DBA Game Time	\$100.00	10%	Printed Catalogs
Playmore West, Inc.	\$125.00	30%	Digital Catalog Printed Catalogs
Playspace Services, Inc.	\$197.50	30%	Digital Catalog with installation pricing
Playpower LT Farmington, Inc.	\$100.00	25%	Printed Catalogs

TABULATION OF BIDS ON PARK AND PLAYGROUND EQUI	PMENT, MCSD No. 21-0053-MR		
ids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2020			
BIDDERS:	ITEM 6: REPAIRS HOURLY RATE- PER HOUR	ITEM 7: PERCENTAGE MARK UP FOR REPAIR MATERIAL	
Project Innovations, Inc.	\$400.00	45%	Digital Catalog Printed Catalogs
Rep Services. Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	Printed Catalogs
Superior Park Systems, Inc. (A)	\$285.00	30%	Printed Catalogs
Swartz Associates, Inc.	\$200.00 (40)	No Bid	No Catalogs
Top Line Recreation, Inc.	\$350.00	30.00%	Digital Catalog
Varsity Sports dba BSN Sports, LLC (42)	No Bid	No Bid	No Catalogs

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2020

#### NOTES:

(1) Open Market/Playgrounds (2) Allsport/2020 Athletic Eqpn (3) or discounts applied in catalog (4) per discount applied in Playspace catalog (5) Discounts included in Playspace/Rubber Designs catalog (6) See attached copy of price list (7) This does not include any site prep, permitting or concrete work. Shelter and shade foundations will be additional. Some vendors offer a delivered and installed price which will be discounted appropriately in the product discount. Site work and concrete including foundations will be priced per job. Sport court construction priced per job. (8) Only Big Toys and Play and Park Structures require installer certification (9) Rental Equipment Mark Up will be 10% as allowed on Page 12 (10) 2020 Manatee Schools Catalog (11) Shade Price (12) 30% Equipment, 60% Site Equipment, Shade 100% (13) Mat Installation is based upon each unit - \$35.00 per unit Border Installation is based upon each unit - \$15.00 per unit Pour in Place Pricing and Turf includes installation EWF installation is based on cubic yard - \$16 per cubic yd Rubber Tile Installation is based upon square footage - \$3 per sq. ft. Rubber Mulch Installation is based upon square footage - \$10.00 per sq. ft. (14) Markup for Repair Materials: Repair materials would be Kompan Spare Parts. Kompan has over 65,000 spare parts for current product lines as well as past product lines. Each part has a retail price and includes all markups. We would be happy to provide a Parts Price List in electronic format, if SDMC would like to view the list. 15) Sell Price + (ADD) % (16) Minimum \$3500.00 (17) 60% of safety surfacing cost (18) 100% of shade structure cost (19) Please note all items may be negotiated for a particular job (20) Kidstuff Playsystems will only service equipment manufactured by Kidstuff Playsystems, Olympic Recreation or Recreation Creations, LLC. (21) 8% \$0000 - \$4999 12% \$5000 - \$9999 15% \$10000 - \$14999 18% \$15000 - \$24999 20% \$25000 - Above Discount does not include freight, specials/sales flyer, parts (22) Bleachers Discount does not include freight, specials/sales flyer, parts (23) Engineered Wood Fiber

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., July 22, 2020

NOTES: (24) or per discounts applied in catalog (25) per discount applied in Playspace catalog (26) Discounts included in Playspace/Rubber Designs Catalog (27) Off Playgrounds Sets - Excludes Tot Builders, Custom Design Studio, Early Childhood Clever Climbers and Tot Tree (28) Off Parts (29) Pages 182 to 185 (30) off site amenities (31) Pages 186 and 187 (32) Off Shade (33) pff Safety Surface (PIP) (34) Which equates to 35% of equipment list price before discount (35) Included in Price (36) Permits/Signed & Sealed Engineered Drawings not included. Prices TBD per Project (37) Note: Prepay + Add Freight for all manufacturers. Any permitting requirements and costs (if applicable) will incur an additional fee. (38) Playground Equipment - 34% Site Equipment - 35% Shade Structure - 110% Surfacing Materials Forestry Resources - 60% Cowart Mulch - 60% IMC Outdoor - 40% Pierection Rubber Products 40% (39) Prepay & Add freight for all manufacturers (40) \$900.00 Minimum charge for installation (41) Industrial Shade Port manufactures and installs our own equipment (42) BSN Sports Exceptions to percentage off bid Spring 2020 catalog-see list (43) Added additional manufacture- Playmore 5-9-2023 for renewal 1 (A)Supplier did not repond to Renewal 1 request after 3 attempts. (B) Additioanl Manufactures added.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.