EXHIBIT A

Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Line 1: FLASHER BARRICADES TYPE |

Description: Shall be Type | as specified in Part VI of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD), Federal
Highway Administration, and shall conform to the requirements of that manual. Price is for 1 day unit rental,
However prior annual quantities estimated at 3497 day units. Prior quantities are not indicative of future
usage of the Co-Op

Item: FLASHER BARRICADES TYPE|  FLASHER BARRICADES TYPE |

Long Item Shall be Type | as specified in Part VI of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD), Federal
Description: Highway Administration, and shall conform to the requirements of that manual.
Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 3497 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage of the Co-Op

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 0.2500 Extended Amount: 0.25
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 2: FLASHER BARRICADES TYPE Il

Description: Shall be Type Il as specified in Part VI of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD), Federal
Highway Administration, and shall conform to the requirements of that manual. Price is for 1 day unit rental,
However prior annual quantities estimated at 3717 day units. Prior quantities are not indicative of future
usage of the Co-op.

Item: FLASHER BARRICADES TYPE Il ~ FLASHER BARRICADES TYPE ||

Long Item Shall be Type Il as specified in Part VI of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD), Federal
Description: Highway Administration, and shall conform to the requirements of that manual.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 3717 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage of the Co-op.

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 0.5000 Extended Amount: 0.50
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 3: FLASHER BARRICADES TYPE Il

Description: Shall be Type Il as specified in Part V| of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD), Federal
Highway Administration, and shall conform to the requirements of that manual. Price is for 1 day unit rental,
However prior annual quantities estimated at 4566 day units. Prior quantities are not indicative of future
usage by the Co-Op

Item: FLASHER BARRICADES TYPE Il FLASHER BARRICADES TYPE lli

Long Item Shall be Type lll as specified in Part VI of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD), Federal
Description: Highway Administration, and shall conform to the requirements of that manual.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 4566 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage by the Co-Op

Commeodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 0.7500 Extended Amount: 0.75
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 4: WARNING & REGULATORY SIGNS

Description: Warning and Regulatory Signs (non-electrical) A shall conform to the requirements and specifications
contained in Part VI of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD), Federal Highway Admin.
Signs shall include, but not be limited to the following: 1. Road Construction A 500 feet. 2. Road Construction
A 1000 feet. 3. Road Construction A 1500 feet. 4. Keep Left 5. Keep Right 6. Detour 7. Left Lane Ends 8. Right
Land Ends 9. Road Closed A Local Traffic Only.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 4786 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage of the Co-Op.

Item: WARNING & REGULATORY SIGNS ~ WARNING & REGULATORY SIGNS

Long Item Warning and Regulatory Signs (non-electrical) shall conform to the requirements and specifications
Description: contained in Part VI of the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD), Federal Highway Admin.
Signs shall include, but not be limited to the following: 1. Road Construction 500 feet. 2. Road Construction
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

1000 feet. 3. Road Construction.

Commodity Code: 968-84  Traffic Control Services (To Include Placement and Removal o

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 0.7500 Extended Amount: 0.75
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 5: TRIPOD STANDS
Description: Will hold small to medium sized signs and shall be approximately 3 feet high.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 1251 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage of the Co-Op.

ltem: TRIPOD STANDS  TRIPOD STANDS

Long Item Will hold small to medium sized signs and shall be approximately 3 feet high.
Description:

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 1251 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage of the Co-Op.

Commodity Code: 968-84  Traffic Control Services (To Include Placement and Removal o

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 0.0100 Extended Amount: 0.01
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 6: SIGN STANDS

Description: Will hold medium to large sized signs and shall be approximately 6 feet high.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 1770 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage by the co-op.

Item: SIGN STANDS  SIGN STANDS

Long Item Will hold medium to large sized signs and shall be approximately 6 feet high.
Description:
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 1770 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage.

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 0.2500 Extended Amount: 0.25
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 7: ARROW BOARDS GENERATOR POWER

Description: Shall consist of flashing lights in the shape of a right or left arrow. Power is provided by means of a gasoline
or diesel generator or a solar powered generator system with battery back up for the hours of darkness. The
arrow board must be capable of continuous operation, 24 hours per day.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 1228 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage.

Item: ARROW BOARDS GENERATOR POWER ~ ARROW BOARDS GENERATOR POWER

Long Item Shall consist of flashing lights in the shape of a right or left arrow. Power is provided by means of a gasoline
Description: or diesel generator or a solar powered generator system with battery back up for the hours of darkness. The
arrow board must be capable of continuous operation, 24 hours per day.

Commodity Code: 968-84  Traffic Control Services {To Include Placement and Removal o

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 25.0000 Extended Amount: 25.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 8: TRAFFIC CONES 36 INCH

Description: 36" with reflective collar. Red/orange or bright fluorescent orange molded PVC, minimum weight 8 Ibs.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 41800 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage by the Co-Op.
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Item: TRAFFIC CONES 36 INCH  TRAFFIC CONES 36 INCH

Long Item 36" with reflective collar. Red/orange or bright fluorescent orange molded PVC, minimum weight 8 Ibs.
Description:
Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 41800 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage.

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 1.0000 Extended Amount: 1.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 9: DRUMS

Description: Drums used for traffic warning or channeling shall be approximately 36" in height and a minimum of 18" in
diameter. The markings on drums shall be horizontal, circumferential, orange and white reflector stripes four
to eight inches wide, using a material that has a smooth, sealed outer surface that will display the same
approximate size, shape and color day and night. There shall be at least two orange and two white stripes on
each drum. If there are non-reflectorized spaces between the horizontal orange and white stripes, they shall
be no more than two inches wide.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 9601 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage by the Co-op.

Item: DRUMS  DRUMS

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 0.3500 Extended Amount: 0.35
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 10: FRENCH BARRICADES

Description: Interlocking steel barriers approximately 7'3" long x 3' 5-3/8" high x 1" tube diameter. Barco model CCB1461
or equal.
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 9395 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage. '

Item: FRENCH BARRICADES =~ FRENCH BARRICADES

Long Item Interlocking steel barriers approximately 7'3" long x 3' 5-3/8" high x 1" tube diameter. Barco model CCB1461
Description: or equal.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 9395 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage.

Commodity Code: 968-84  Traffic Control Services (To Include Placement and Removal o

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 3.0000 Extended Amount: 3.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 11: MESSAGE BOARDS

Description: Variable message board, rechargeable battery operated, as specified in the FDOT Roadway and Traffic
Design Standards Manual. Boards may be solar-powered, diesel or gas powered with a 25 hour capacity,
maintained by vendor per FDOT specifications.

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 5435 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage.

Item: MESSAGE BOARDS  MESSAGE BOARDS

Long Item Variable message board, rechargeable battery operated, as specified in the FDOT Roadway and Traffic
Description: Design Standards Manual. Boards may be solar-powered, diesel or gas powered with a 25 hour capacity,
maintained by vendor per FDOT specific

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 35.0000 Extended Amount: 35.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Line 12: TRAFFIC BARRIERS

Description: Triton barrier with bracket mount for sign post/light manufactured by Energy Absorption Systems Inc. or

equal. Water filled plastic jersey barrier with internal metal frame and type AA" lights furnished and installed
(FDOT #99-71023-11).

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 25246 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage.

Item: TRAFFIC BARRIERS  TRAFFIC BARRIERS

Long Item Triton barrier with bracket mount for sign post/light manufactured by Energy Absorption Systems Inc. or
Description: equal. Water filled plastic jersey barrier with internal metal frame and type AA" lights furnished and installed
(FDOT #99-71023-11).

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 25246 day units.

Commodity Code: 968-84  Traffic Control Services (To Include Placement and Removal o

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 4.0000 Extended Amount: 4.00
No Charge: No ' No Bid: No

Line 13: VERTICAL PANELS
Description: Temporary, Type V.P., with type AA® lights, FDOT #102-74-1, 36" X 12",

Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 1237 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage.

item: VERTICAL PANELS  VERTICAL PANELS

Long Item Temporary, Type V.P., with type AA® lights, FDOT #102-74-1, 36" X 12".
Description:
Price is for 1 day unit rental, However prior annual quantities estimated at 1237 day units. Prior quantities
are not indicative of future usage.

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 0.2500 Extended Amount: 0.25
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 14: BARRIER (CAUTION) TAPE (300'ROLLS)

Description: Barrier (Caution) tape A shall consist of 3 inch by 3 mil by 300 feet roll of yellow, reflective tape with the
word ACAUTION* printed in black at intervals on the entire length of the tape.

Price is for 1 roll, However prior annual quantities estimated at 930 rolls. Prior quantities are not indicative of
future usage.

Item: BARRIER (CAUTION) TAPE (300°'ROLL  BARRIER (CAUTION) TAPE (300'ROLLS)

Long Item Barrier (Caution) tape A shall consist of 3 inch by 3 mil by 300 feet roll of yellow, reflective tape with the
Description: word ACAUTION" printed in black at intervals on the entire length of the tape.

Price is for 1 roll, However prior annual quantities estimated at 930 rolls. Prior quantities are not indicative of
future usage.

Commodity Code: 968-84  Traffic Control Services (To Include Placement and Removal o

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: DA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 2.5000 Extended Amount: 2.50
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 15: OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE, FLASHER BARRICADES 1-20

Description: Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of from 1 to 20 flasher
barricades.

Price is for 1 set up, However prior annual quantities estimated at 200 set ups. Prior quantities are not
indicative of future usage by the Co-Op
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Item: OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE, FLASHER ~ OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE, FLASHER BARRICADES 1-20

Long Item Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
Description: City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of from 1 to 20 flasher
barricades. '

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: LO
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 30.0000 Extended Amount: 30.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 16: OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE, FLASHER BARRICADES 21-50

Description: Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of from 21 to 50 flasher
barricades.

Price is for 1 set up, However prior annual quantities estimated at 150 set ups. Prior quantities are not
indicative of future usage

Item: 21-50 OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE ~ OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE, FLASHER BARRICADES 21-50

Long Item Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
Description: City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of from 21 to 50 flasher
barricades.

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: LO
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 35.0000 Extended Amount: 35.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Description: Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of from 51 to 100 flasher
barricades.

Price is for 1 set up, However prior annual quantities estimated at 75 set ups. Prior quantities are not
indicative of future usage.

Item: 51-100 OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE ~ OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE, FLASHER BARRICADES 51-100

Long Item Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
Description: City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of from 51 to 100 flasher
barricades.

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: LO
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 40.0000 Extended Amount: 40.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

![mf 18: OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE, FLASHER BARRICADES OVER |

Description: Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of over 100 flasher
barricades.

Price is for 1 set up, However prior annual quantities estimated at 50 set ups. Prior quantities are not
indicative of future usage.

Item: 100-OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE =~ OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICE, FLASHER BARRICADES OVER 100

Long Item Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
Description: City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-

up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of over 100 flasher
barricades.

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease
Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: LO
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 100.0000 Extended Amount: 100.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 19: OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICES, SIGNS 1-10

Description: Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of from 1 to 10 signs.

Price is for 1 set up, However prior annual quantities estimated at 50 set ups. Prior quantities are not
indicative of future usage .

ftem: 1-10 OPTIONAL SET UP-SIGNS  1-10 OPTIONAL SET UP-SIGNS

Long Item Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
Description: City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of from 1 to 10 signs.

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: LO
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 30.0000 Extended Amount: 30.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 20: OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICES, SIGNS OVER 10

Description: Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of over 10 signs.

Price is for 1 set up, However prior annual quantities estimated at 25 set ups. Prior quantities are not
indicative of future usage.

Item: 10-OPTIONAL SET UP SIGNS ~ OPTIONAL SET UP SERVICES, SIGNS OVER 10

Long Item Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
Description: City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up one lot of over 10 signs.

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: LO
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 25.0000 Extended Amount: 25.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 21: LANE CLOSURE

Description: Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up 1 lane closure with signs,
barricades and 1 arrow board.

Price is for 1 set up, However prior annual quantities estimated at 10 set ups. Prior quantities are not
indicative of future usage-

item: LANE CLOSURE  LANE CLOSURE

Long Item Normally, the rental items requested in 1 through 13 above will be delivered to a stated site and set-up by
Description: City or agency staff. However, where such staff is unavailable, it may be necessary for the Contractor to set-
up this equipment. The bidder shall quote a firm fixed price for setting up 1 lane closure with signs,
barricades and 1 arrow board.

Commodity Code: 968-84  Traffic Control Services (To Include Placement and Removal o

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: JA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 250.0000 Extended Amount: 250.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 22: OPTIONAL SERVICES, MOT DRAWINGS/PERMIT

Description: A participating agency may sometimes be required to perform work on a state, county or city roadway that
requires a Maintenance of Traffic drawing and permit. The bidder will state a fee for this service.

Price is for 1 MOT Drawing/Permit, However prior annual quantities estimated at 200 drawings/permits. Prior
quantities are not indicative of future usage.
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Item: OPTIONAL SERVICES, MOT DRAWINGS  OPTIONAL SERVICES, MOT DRAWINGS/PERMIT

Long Item A participating agency may sometimes be required to perform work on a state, county or city roadway that
Description: requires a Maintenance of Traffic drawing and permit. The bidder will state a fee for this service.

Price is for 1 MOT Drawing/Permit, However prior annual quantities estimated at 200 drawings/permits. Prior
quantities are not indicative of

Commodity Code: 968-84  Traffic Control Services (To Include Placement and Removal o

Quantity: 1.06000 Unit of Measure: EA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 50.0000 Extended Amount: 50.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 23: OPTIONAL SERVICES, SITE VISIT

Description: |f the Contractor has set-up the barricades and other devices per the optional set-up services of paragraph
2.06, and a MOT permit requires that the site be inspected periodically to insure compliance with the MOT
drawing, the Contractor will perform this service at the request of the agency. The bidder will state a cost per
site visit for this service.

Price is for 1 visit, However prior annual quantities estimated at 25 visits. Prior quantities are not indicative of
future usage.

Item: OPTIONAL SERVICES, SITE VISIT ~ OPTIONAL SERVICES, SITE VISIT

Long Item If the Contractor has set-up the barricades and other devices per the optional set-up services of paragraph
Description: 2.06, and a MOT permit requires that the site be inspected periodically to insure compliance with the MOT
drawing, the Contractor will perform this service at the request of the agency. The bidder will state a cost per
site visit

Commodity Code: 968-84  Traffic Control Services (To Include Placement and Removal o

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: EA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 25.0000 Extended Amount: 25.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No
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Event # 203-3: Barricades and Equipment Rental (Co-Op)

Line 24: TEMP FENCE PANELS

Description: Temp Fence panels (6'H X 10'W) -

Price is for 1 visit, However prior annual quantities estimated at 150 panels. Prior quantities are not
indicative of future usage by the Co-op.

Item: TEMP FENCE PANELS  TEMP FENCE PANELS

Long Item 17.Temp Fence panels (6’'H X 10'W)
Description:

Commodity Code: 985-73  Signs, Message Boards and Centers, etc., Rental or Lease

Quantity: 1.0000 Unit of Measure: EA
Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 7.0000 Extended Amount: 7.00
No Charge: No No Bid: No
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