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MASTER CONTRACTOR/SERVICES AGREEMENT

THIS AGREEMENT ("Agreement") is by and between the City of Delray Beach, a Florida
municipal corporation (hereinafter referred to as the "City") whose address is 100 NW I Avenue,
Delray Beach, FL 33444 and Design Lab, Inc., (hereinafter referred to as "Contractor"), whose address
is 1753 NW 20St., Miami, FL 33142, this day of2025.

WHEREAS the City desires to purchase uniforms and services for its Fire Rescue Department;
and

WHEREAS the City desires to procure these goods and services from Contractor utilizing
existing contract prices provided to Brevard County pursuant to Invitation to Bid ('ITB") No. B- 2-25-
37, Uniform Apparel- Fire Rescue; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with ITB No. B- 2-25-37, Brevard County entered into a five (5)
year agreement with Contractor for goods and services effective April 8, 2025 through April 7, 2030
with option to renew for one (1) additional year period ("Contract No. B-2-25-37"); and

WHEREAS the City desires to procure uniforms and services from Contractor on the same
terms, conditions, and pricing provided to Brevard County pursuant to ITB No. B-2-25-37, subject to
the terms and conditions of this Agreement, the City's Purchasing ordinance, and Florida law.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual promises contained herein and other
good and valuable consideration ofwhich the parties hereto acknowledge, the parties agree as follows:

1. The above recitals are true and correct and are incorporated herein by reference.

2. The Contractor shall provide uniforms and services for the City, in accordance with and
pursuant to the same terms, conditions, and pricing of Contract No. B-2-25-37 procured by Brevard
County, in accordance with the Contractor's Price Proposal Summary attached hereto as Exhibit "A".

3. This Agreement shall terminate on April 7, 2030, unless Contract No. B-2-25-37 is
renewed by Brevard County. IfContract No. B-2-25-37 is renewed, this Agreement shall automatically
renew.

4. The City, at its sole discretion reserves the right to terminate this Agreement with or
without cause immediately upon providing written notice to Contractor. Upon receipt of such notice,
the Contractor shall not incur any additional costs under the Agreement. The City shall be liable only
for the reasonable costs incurred by Contractor prior to the date of the notice of termination. The City
shall be the sole judge of "reasonable costs."

5. The Contractor certifies that the price and rate represent the lowest price and rate for the
products and services of any contract between the Contractor and any other governmental entity within
the State of Florida.

6. The Contractor shall indemnify and hold harmless the City and its officers, employees,
agents, and instrumentalities from any and all liability, losses or damages, including attorney's fees
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and costs of defense, which the City or its officers, employees, agents, or instrumentalities may incur
as a result of claims, demands, suits, causes of actions, or proceedings of any kind or nature arising out
of, relating to, or resulting from the performance of the agreement by the Contractor or its employees,
agents, servants, partners, principals, or subcontractors. The Contractor shall pay all claims and losses
in connection therewith, and shall investigate and defend all claims, suits, or actions of any kind or
nature in the name of the City, where applicable, including appellate proceedings, and shall pay all
costs, judgments, and attorney's fees which may be incurred thereon. The Contractor expressly
understands and agrees that any insurance protection required by this Agreement or otherwise provided
by the Contractor shall in no way limit the responsibility to indemnify, keep and save harmless, and
defend the City or its officers, employees, agents, and instrumentalities as herein provided the
obligations of this section shall survive the term of this Agreement.

7. Whenever either Party desires to give notice to the other, such notice must be in writing,
sent by certified United States Mail, postage prepaid, return receipt requested, or sent by commercial
express carrier with acknowledgement of delivery, or by hand delivery with a request for a written
receipt of acknowledgment of delivery, addressed to the party for whom it is intended at the place last
specified. The place for giving notice shall remain the same as set forth herein until changed in writing
in the manner provided in this section. For the present, the Parties designate the following:

For CITY:

City of Delray Beach
100 N.W. 1st Avenue
Delray Beach, Florida 33444
Attn: City Manager

For CONTRACTOR:

Design Lab, Inc.
1753 NW 20St.
Miami, FL 33142
Phone: 864-297-7199
Email: mattpmoller@yahoo.com
Attn: Matt P. Moller, CEO

8. Neither this Agreement nor any right or interest herein shall be assigned, transferred, or
encumbered without the written consent of the other Party.

9. This Agreement shall be construed in accordance with the City of Delray Beach's Code
of Ordinances and the laws of the State of Florida. Any dispute relating to this Agreement shall only
be filed in a court of competent jurisdiction in Palm Beach County, Florida, and each of the parties to
this Agreement submits itself to the jurisdiction of such court. It is hereby understood and agreed that
in the event any lawsuit in the judicial system, federal or state, is brought to enforce compliance with
this contract or interpret same, or if any administrative proceeding is brought for the same purposes,
each party shall pay their own attorney's fees and costs, including appellate fees and costs.
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10. IF THE CONTRACTOR HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING THE
APPLICATION OF CHAPTER 119, FLORIDA STATUTES, TO THE
CONTRACTOR'S DUTY TO PROVIDE PUBLIC RECORDS RELATING TO
THIS AGREEMENT, CONTACT THE CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC RECORDS
AT CITY OF DELRAY BEACH, CITY CLERK, 100 N.W. 1°' AVE., DELRAY
BEACH FLORIDA. THE CITY CLERK'S OFFICE MAY BE CONTACTED BY
PHONE AT 561-243-7050 OR VIA EMAIL AT
CITYCLERK@MYDELRAYBEACH.COM.

a. Contractor shall comply with public records laws, specifically to:

1. Keep and maintain public records required by the City to perform the service.

11. Upon request from the City's custodian of public records, provide the City with
a copy of the requested records or allow the records to be inspected or copied
within a reasonable time at a cost that does not exceed the cost provided in
Florida Statute or as otherwise provided by law.

111. Ensure that public records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from
public records disclosure requirements are not disclosed except as authorized by
law for the duration of the Agreement term and following completion of the
Agreement if the Contractor does not transfer the records to the City.

iv. Upon completion of the Agreement, transfer, at no cost, to the City all public
records in possession of the Contractor or keep and maintain public records
required by the City to perform the service. If the Contractor transfers all public
records to the City upon completion of the Agreement, the Contractor shall
destroy any duplicate public records that are exempt or confidential and exempt
from public records disclosure requirements. If the Contractor keeps and
maintains public records upon completion of the Agreement, the Contractor
shall meet all applicable requirements for retaining public records. All records
stored electronically must be provided to the City, upon request from the City's
custodian of public records, in a format that is compatible with the information
technology systems of the City.

v. If the Contractor does not comply with this section, the City shall enforce the
contract provisions in accordance with the contract and may unilaterally cancel
this contract in accordance with state law.

11. Contractor is aware that the Inspector General of Palm Beach County has the authority
to investigate and audit matters relating to the negotiation and performance of this contract and may
demand and obtain records and testimony from Contractor and its subcontractors and lower tier
subcontractors. Contractor understands and agrees that in addition to all other remedies and
consequences provided by law, the failure of Contractor or its subcontractors and lower tier
subcontractors to fully cooperate with the Inspector General when requested may be deemed by the
City to be a material breach of this Agreement justifying its termination.
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12. The continuation of this Agreement beyond the end of any fiscal year shall be subject
to both the appropriation and the availability of funds in accordance with Florida law.

13. By entering into this Agreement, Contractor acknowledges its obligation to comply with
the provisions of Section 448.095, Fla. Stat., "Employment Eligibility." Contractor affirms and
represents it is registered with the E-Verify system, utilizing same, and will continue to utilize same as
required by law. Compliance with this section includes, but is not limited to, utilization of the E-Verify
System to verify the work authorization status of all newly hired employees and requiring all
subcontractors to provide an affidavit attesting that the subcontractor does not employ, contract with,
or subcontract with, an unauthorized alien. Failure to comply with this section will result in the
termination of this Agreement, or if your subcontractor knowingly violates the statute, the subcontract
must be terminated immediately. Any challenge to termination under this provision must be filed in
the Circuit Court no later than 20 calendar days after the date of termination. If terminated for a
violation of the statute by Contractor, the Contractor may be prohibited from conducting future
business with the City or awarded a solicitation or contract for a period of 1 year after the date of
termination. All costs incurred to initiate and sustain the aforementioned programs shall be the
responsibility of the Contractor.

14. Pursuant to Section 287.134, Florida Statutes, an entity or affiliate who has been
placed on the discriminatory vendor list may not submit a bid, proposal, or reply on a contract to
provide any goods or services to a public entity; may not submit a bid, proposal, or reply on a
contract with a public entity for the construction or repair of a public building or public work; may
not submit bids, proposals, or replies on leases of real property to a public entity; may not be
awarded or perform work as a contractor, supplier, subcontractor, or consultant under a contract
with any public entity; and may not transact business with any public entity. By execution of this
Agreement, Contractor represents that it has not been placed on the discriminatory vendor list as
provided in Section 287.134, Florida Statutes.

15. Pursuant to Section 287.135, Contractor is ineligible to enter into, or renew, this
Agreement if Contractor is on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List (as identified in
Section 215.4725, Florida Statutes), or is engaged in a boycott oflsrael.

a. By entering into this Agreement, Contractor certifies that Contractor is not on
the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List, and that Contractor is not
engaged in a boycott of Israel.

b. Contractor shall notify the City if, at any time during the term of this
Agreement, Contractor is placed on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott
Israel List, or that Contractor is engaged in a boycott of Israel. Such
notification shall be in writing and provided by Contractor to the City within ten
( 1 O) days of the date of such occurrence.

c. In the event the City determines, using credible information available to the public,
that Contractor has submitted a false certification or Contractor is found to have
been placed on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List or engaged in a
boycott of Israel, the City may, in its sole discretion, terminate this Agreement and

Page 4 of 8



P2025-037
Brevard County ITB #B-2-25-37 Uniform Apparel -Fire Rescue

seek a civil penalty, and other damages and relief, against Contractor, pursuant to
Section 287.135, Florida Statutes. In addition, the City may pursue any and all other
legal remedies against Contractor.

d. Contractor shall not seek damages, fees, or costs against the City in the event the
City terminates the Agreement pursuant to this provision.

16. By its execution of this Agreement, Contractor acknowledges that it has been informed
by City of, and is in compliance with the terms of Section 287.133(2)(a) of the Florida Statutes which
read as follows:

"A person or affiliate who has been placed on the convicted vendor list following a
conviction for a public entity crime may not submit a bid, proposal, or reply on a
contract to provide any goods or services to a public entity; may not submit a bid,
proposal, or reply on a contract with a public entity for the construction or repair of a
public building or public work; may not submit bids, proposals, or replies on leases of
real property to a public entity, may not be awarded or perform work as a contractor,
supplier, subcontractor, or consultant under a contract with any public entity; and may
not transact business with any public entity in excess of the threshold amount provided
in s. 287.017 for CATEGORY TWO for a period of 36 months following the date of
being placed on the convicted vendor list."

17. The Contractor and its services under this Agreement must comply with all applicable
federal, state, and local laws, codes, ordinances, rules, and regulations including, without limitation,
American with Disabilities Act, 42 U.S.C. § 12101, Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, and
any related federal, state, or local laws, rules, and regulations. The Contractor agrees to provide to the
City all necessary certifications required by any federal, state, and local laws, ordinances, codes, rules
and regulations. The Contractor's obligations under this Section shall survive termination, cancellation
or expiration of this Agreement.

18. Pursuant to Fla. Stat. §286.101(3), where the amount of the Agreement is $100,000.00
or more, Contractor shall disclose any current or prior interest of, any contract with, or any grant or gift
received from a country of foreign concern with a value of $50,000 or more that was received or in
force during the previous five (5) years. Definitions, disclosure requirements and exceptions are found
in Fla. Stat. §268.1 O l. Contractor represents and warrants it has complied with Fla. Stat. §286.1 O 1, it
has properly disclosed such interests, contracts, grants or gifts to the City before execution of this
Agreement, and it will remain in compliance with Fla. Stat. $286.10 1 for the duration of this
Agreement.

19. Section 287.138, Florida Statutes, prohibits the City from entering into a contract which
would give access to an individual's personal identifying information with an entity with; a Controlling
Interest (as that term is defined in sub-section 287.138(1)(a)), or full ownership, held by a Foreign
Country of Concern (as that term is defined in sub-section 287.138(l)(c)), or with a principal place of
business in a Foreign Country of Concern, unless the entity provides the City with an affidavit signed
by an officer or representative of the entity under penalty of perjury attesting that the entity does not
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meet any of the criteria in paragraphs (2)(a)-(c) of the statute. Upon submitting its Work Order,
Contractor shall certify compliance with section 287.138, Florida Statutes, by executing the Proposer
Certification regarding Entities of Foreign Countries of Concern, which is included in Attachment 2.
The City reserves the right to terminate any agreement in which a CONTRACTOR provides a false
certification or otherwise violates Section 287.138, Florida Statutes.

20. Contractor has fully complied with Florida Statute §787.06(13), which requires all
nongovernmental entities executing, renewing, or extending a contract with a governmental entity to
provide an affidavit signed by an officer or representative of the nongovernmental entity under penalty
of perjury that the nongovernmental entity does not use coercion for labor or services as defined in that
statute as evidenced by affidavit provided to the City.

21. Contractor shall provide insurance in accordance with Exhibit "B" attached hereto.

22. The documents listed below are a part of this Agreement and are hereby incorporated
by reference. In the event of inconsistency between the documents, unless otherwise provided herein,
the terms of the following documents will govern in the following order of precedence:

a. Tenns and conditions as contained in this Agreement

b. Terms and conditions of Contract No. B-2-25-37

c. Contractor's response to Solicitation ITB No. B-2-25-37 and any subsequent
information submitted by Contractor during the evaluation and negotiation
process.

[Remainder of this Page is Intentionally Blank]
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the City and Contractor executed this contract as of the day and year
first above written.

ATTEST:

Alexis Givings, City Clerk

Approved as to form and legal sufficiency:

Lynn Gelin, City Attorney

(SEAL)

STATE OF Sh (Cc l
COUNTY OF ¿cg ch0 le_

CITY OF DELRAY BEACH

By: _
Thomas F. Camey, Jr., Mayor

DESIGN LAB, INC.

Print Name: _DO>Ar /T.
Title: z

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me by means ofphysical presence or DJ
online notarization, this 23 day of Hu£ts7 2025, by
l an be.s Pall¡ (name ofperson), as (type ofauthority)

for _De.jnLah_,_a_ (name of party on behalf ofwhom instrument was executed).

Personally known {_ OR Produced Ide
Type of Identification Produced pLz

_Zs4 L.
Notary Public State of S_.2Caln,
jscm.lle
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Exhibit "A" - Pricing (11 Pages)
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Design Lab Inc
1OT E: Station Wear /AND/STYLE

L Men's Pants(Daily wear): %./ or, 1or 31IFstTac hitar,
Polyester, Adustuble waistband.Size: 28 5¢, Style474461 "No
color: Dlak Substitutions" NO Bid

2 Mes Pants(Daily wear: Polyester Blend
\dustable wasttsi, -poket Se.6-69
tcotor: Biar No id

3 Ladies: Pant(Daily wear). 4.7 0. 100X 5.1last-Ia. Ubarn,
Polyeteer,dutabte waistband, Size: 2-20 Sy'er6120 "No
(À¢- 14L Substitutions" No 3id
taaes: Pant(Daly wear): Polyester blend,
dustable waistband, Size: 22- 2 (Color: Black

No Bid
I OFFICE Pants {Daily Wear): 75% polyester, + ling Cross men's

2%wcol, freedom fie stretch band. Cc!or: scte weave wool
Black Size: 2842 blend. Mr6447280. \

"No Substitutions" No id
8 UHF IE Pmnts (Daly Wear): /5 polyester, FNying Cross men's -

25%wool, freedom flex stueth band serewe3ve wool
Color(s): Black« Sire: 4454 blend. Mt#47280.

No Substitutions" No Bid
9 shirt(0a'y wear): 1/5, 656/35 Fe.theiret f iyu

Cotan/Permanent ress w/break restant Cross 35/5400
buttons. Sze(neck) 14-17.5 Colors. Light blue /35543s "No
ni Wtute Substitution" No Bid

10 Shut(Duly wean}: 1JS, B»/3» Fe.hheiret Flyiny
Cotton/Permanent Pres w/break resistant Cross 35W5400
buttons. Sietnek}: 18-22 Colors: ti;ht Blue 135w903 "No
dad$ Substitution" N'o Bid

11 Lodes Shirt(Daily wear): 1/5, 65/35 +chhemmer Hlyin,
Corton/Permanent Press w/break resistant Cros6 12615600 /5435
buttons. Sire: ?4 42; Colors: ught blue and 'No Substitution"
auk{a No Bid

17 Lodes hurt(uaily wear): L/S, 65/35 Hech:eiunr Hlyit,
Cotton/Permanent Press w/break resistant Cr03s 126+5400 /535
buttons. Slue: 44-56 Colors. Lipht Blue and "No Substitution"
Whte No Bid

B-2-25-3//uniform Apparel- Hre Hesue
Attachment A - Prie Sheet
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13 s/rt{Oily wear): S/5s, 55/35 echherner flymn I

Cutton/Permanent Press w/break resistant Cr085156435/5400
buttons Sue(neck}. 14-17.5 Colors: Light Blue "NoSubstituto"
Mt t/hin No Bid

14 8nir(0aiy wear): $/, 66/35 Fechteimer Hing
Cotto/Pea;et Press w/teak resistant Crs 85R5435/5400
hatton:. Size{neck) 18-22 Colors: Liht Blue "No Substitution"
a+u+ /hito No Bid

15 tcdies Shirt(at'y wear): $/, 65/3 + echheimer Flying
Cotton/Permanent Press w/break resistant Cross 176R5400/5435
buttons, Size 2 42 Colors: tuht Blue and "No Substitution"
tir#»a No id

16 1dle;hr(D3Ny Wér). S/, 65/35 fect:hemmer F 'yin,e
Cotton/Permanent Press w/urvak testant cross 176R5400/5435
button. Se{nod}; 44 56 Colors: Liph: Blue "No Substitution"
n4 Mi4, No id

LOT IE: Dress Uniform US NAYOFFICER BLUE BRAND/SYLE

+ cchherner 288s96 ;
23 Pnts + Dre {Jitcnms 5/4 Poly/Wool "No Substitution

(hemmingcost ituded in pico)
No 'id

24 laker Fehheiune • /38696€
"No Substitution" No ali

Hat(HIE) whte tieMt trown with Wik Viv·t keystone R-EB{244) i2 Maud ani f Hutto.u»honed sweatband, NoSubstitution"
individually sized ty narercl measurements. No 3id-

Ky10n10 R(149)Ht(B!AK] A! lueell own withf buttons,
26 Non-adjustable. Cushionedsweatband, "No Substitution"

ndrtdualy szd ty nurerial ne3suremgnt. No Bid

AT[RAHOMS: vendor must be able to provide elterations to new and existing apparel
fems due to serve and rank than»ea equwested tin/t rt to irlude any hlpping
hones. ALL GAM!NHS MUSI HT RFTURNED WITHIN 14 DAYS

27 Hemming. Pants No Bid
28 Patch Removal No Bid
79 ZIpper Replacement No 8id
30 Hale Patchin: < 3/8" diameter No Bid
31 Button Replacement NoBid



-2-2-3//untormn npparel- tire fesue
Attachment A - Price Sheet

. - pg32 Maltese Cross
33 Stuipin; {ran) Chane

E.
-

LOT Il: Acessories

3
welt. Leath:t, MUST HAVE FU!INSIDE

utyran 5121u
VELCRO. Sie X54x s 25.A15

35
Belt Leather, 1 3/4 Ganison belt, Size 2-

Duty7nan 161I
68 $ 23.75

35 Te: fur- I Mand, Ply/wool Samuel Broome 45!40
$ 7.65

36
ne(MACK}. CAi-On, baci, 3" {various Samnue! Dr0oie 45055,
lengths) 45033, 45015, 40.5 $ 7.8

31 tardees T+(AK): ro-ve, buttun s1+ß amse HM,o;ne 4,115

$ 6.4
kots {STAON}men's, " side zipper, Ihor0good, #834

38 waterproof, lyhtweir;ht. Color: Black. Size{s). 6219/Commando
4-15. Wid(s]: Medium, Wi«ie, Extra-irte Deuce.

"No Substitutions" $ 109.89
cot (STATON)mnn', 8" 2iet, waterrot. Hoky Alpha-+ore,

39 Color. Black. Se(}:4-15. id:(5). #2113.
s/li,pn i "No Substitution," $ 104.S0
ft {TAT)urns, sip«:n, twrpare 5.11Conary0ot 3.0,

40 ·hunk. Color: lack. Size{): 4 15. Width!): #12420. "No
9piar ty¡¡ substitutions" $ 102.1
cots (1A/ION}men's, B8" Side Zip Jump horogood 131-

1 Bcot. Color' Black. Snze(s). 4-19. Width(s): 688/8" Side Zip Jump
Reular, Wiue boot, ·No

substitutions' $ 113.90

LOT IV: BCFR Honor Guard Uniform BRAND/TIE
Dress 3louse: Black 55/5 Poly Wool

41 Gabardine )h.'5oz, 1ailored pattern fmt, zing
1, MA¢e Toeasure No Bid
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eco.pst.oc+t@io%net@i6z±E9E& 20

~

-'

--
1rouser: Black 5/4 Poly Wool Gabardine
16.50:, I£X GRI Waistband, Dou'te ttetal

12 Hook Closure and Buttoned Ftenh Fly vth
Yi«K Bras, Zipper, M±try hem, Stnr ts Made
to Masure No 3id
stom Cover: Blak 5/45 Ply Wot Set@e,

43 flNy tined, Frted 5iin, cushioned
aciustable inset No Bid

44 felt : Pre:nere Clerino Honor Guatd Belt vnth t'em t, PL403tu
Go!d buckle and NO ta

No Bid
'1~ hoes Bates Clarno aith leather Pottom tren4 E00C07 No tid

ustom toulder trublem: 3. x4 shed
Shaped Cutom Honor Guard Emblemn in

46 lack, Hed and Go!ß Threads to
tMth the Des Hloue

NVo Bid

LOT V: PATCH APPLICATIONS. Unit cost to include ordering, shipping, and
arment application. AL GARMENTS MUST BE RETURNEDWITHIN 14
DAYS. Patch sample website: www.flpatch.com

47 PATCH. Fire Department No Bird .
48 PACH: Dress No Bid---
49 PATCH: Dress Retirement No id
50 PATH: Orean Rosrue fo id
1 PYCH. Forida f'aramedic w/b'ue border

No Bid
2 ACHE: Horida EMI No Erd
53 PA{CI: First Responder No Bid
54 PATCH. Honor Guard No Bid



I

Design Lab Inc
BADGES
Blkunton Badge #300/Rhodium/Stale of Fonda Seel
Lettering. Huetghte; or Reservist o; Dispatch or Ocean
Rescue or Paramedic r EMI No Bid
Blakinton badge # B300/Gold/State of Florida Seal
Lettenng: Lieutenant or Honor Guard or Inspector or Dstit
h.et or Assistant Chit No Bid
Blahinton Badge rB300/Two-Toe/State of Fords Seal
Lettering: Drpatch Supervisor or Communtcations Mana9es No Bid

COLLAR BRASS
Blackinuton Collar Bras AZ909/I Eugle, OD No Bid
(lackinton Collar Brass #A2907/3 Bugles, COLD No Bid
lackJnton Col'r Urass #+A290//3 1ugles, SIVER No Bid
8lackunton Coller Brass #AZ906/4 Bugles, GOLD No Jid
Blakinton A8903 BLUE eam/3 Bugles, SILVER 11/15° No id
Blaklnton A8906 Blue enamel/ ! Bugle, Siver 11/16 No id
Hl3xIt +! • gO!C DuqIe; on 4od Da+grou1a I/16
cellar brass No id
t1kakItonn'V» HçO Dug!es op ra enamel hait]round
15/16° colla: Mass No id
/I+CkIIO A!54 W/!WU') a,pea, M!VtK DU]MS/ tUt
background No Bid
8lack+r.ton A2904/ 1 ugle, Gold No id
lackunton A2902 / 3 Bugle, Gold No Bid
Bl+3to A2547JKZ907 iiüöidI 5iWr ii@es/Te
background No Bid
3lakinton A1962DE / gold bugles/red enamel No Bid
lckinton 41362 /old bug/es rold rays No Bid i

I
Blackinton A257 w/2905 applied gold bugles/red enamel No Bid !

t

Blackinton2815DF /gold bugle/red enamel No Bid

ICLASS A BADGES I
Bl.kinton dass A Badge #B81496/Gold/State of Florida Seal [ I

B-2-25-37/Uiform Apparel - Fire Rescue
Attachment - Price Sheet
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Lettering. Asrtunt Chet or Cief or District Chwet or Lieutenant
or fire Inspector No Bid
BIFinoiüass k Budge FBI)/Rhodium/tale o Florida
Seal
Lettering: Firefighter No i8id
lakirton usadj 7[IT35/Two-Toned?tatot
Flou(da Sea'
ettering: DOipsatch upsvisor or Communicatons Manager No Bid- - -
HAI PINS
!ackurton das A Hat Pn, Gold M2912
enter: !bugleiw/crew tsk attachment No id
lakuvton Gass A Hat Pin, GLD AI92
Center: 4 uges w/saew back attachment No Bl1
Slackinton lass A Ht Fin, avr A2327
Center: Fre Scramtle w/strew tk attachment No ±id
Blackington Class AA Hat Pin, Gld A232/
Center: Fire Sramtle w/saew bok attachment No 3id I
lac.kr:ton lass A Hat Pin, GOLD AZ910 : ICGenter: 3 Bales w/saew back attachmert No 5id
Blackunton Gass A hat pin, Gold A1962DE
Center: Bulges w/srrew back; attachmert No BI
lakttan Class A hat pin, A2815DE
Center: 5 gold bulges, ret enamal background No Bid

NAME PLATES
Blakunton Na::e Plate )3/Silve w/Polis.cd +ntsh
Cluth Ba/Fust litual, Last Narne No id
Blackunton Nae Ptate 7)3/Gold w/Polished finish
dutch Back/First Intial, Last Name No Bid

SPECIALTY ITEMS
)9 Reureu name pate/ gold / rtodur No Bid
Iup t Je; teIIJIte!/LICUO'/USITnvet/r re
Inspectnr/is.natch Super visor/ No Bid
DOrspatcher/Deputy Chlet to Bid
ottm title: Retired No Did

B-2-25-37/Uniform Apparel - Fire Re:cue

Attachment - Pre Sheet



B-2-25-3//Uniform Apparel- Fire Resue
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Item Description BrandSku/Item #
Desin tab Inc

1 Ucaniea 9" tupo0ng 1500 > Ju.'
Emtroiderv. w/1-olor "BOCR"
2 .a: Color; Black; Mult-otor logo embroidered on front, tlex tit or snap Port Authority Hex;it Mesh
back ak Cap MFG# C812 $ 1.49
3. Jake: • Gidan 1860 Heavy Flen fl-Zip Hooded Sweat:hit 'no Gilda 180
suhstitutions"olrs: Naw. Red Size XS- Xt: Embroiderv: otor loo: $ 26.85
4. Lifeguatd torts (men's) Maui tippers 19" Color: Nay,Red, Black no Maul Rippers 19"
substitutions $ 43.95
Screenprint. Se: 30 3 ·,à

<; H itepuard h10rt5 (women') Mui kpper» Co:or: Ntuvy, ed, black no Maus per, 19'
substitutions $ 13.95
Srecpnt Sie,X'
f. Gildan 18200 Heavy Blend Swea!pant: Navy, Red XS XL " no substitutions i:n G18.200
Screenprint $ 16.15
¥.HJes Men's Performance tank, X-Terp Moisture-Wicking Tank Top, Navy Hanes X-Temp Tank
and Litt Steel "o substitution" :

s 10.95
8. TShirt: Snort sleeve Hanes Men' cool Dr ()pt 50 Moisture wicking "no Hanes Cool Upt 50
substitutions«e: XS-XL; Color: Graphite $ 12.30
9. I-Sturt: onSleeve Hanes Mn's cool Dr Upt 50 Moisture Wikins no Hanes Cool Ut 50
substitutions Sate: XS-XL; Color Graphite s 17.30
10 T«hirt (men's), tot sleeve, 100Xrt;on. Si7e: S-XI Gi'don G20c0 s 10.95
Screenprmnt: 4-co!or lopo; w/I color dept/title name (below) w/1 color on
tare çlor: white rev
11 Tshirt {men's), hon sleeve, 100%cotton. Sze: 2X5X oi!d.G2000 $ 12.95
Screenprint: 4-color logo; w/1-color dept/tutle name (be'ow) 'w/1 color on
bac{" olor: wisite rev
12 7-shirt {men's), Iatg sleeve, 90/10 coton/poly. Size: $-XL Gildan G24to $ 16.70
Screenprint: 4 color loo; w/1-color dept/tutle name (below or left chest)
w/1 color on back", "silk-screening down right arun" Color. White, grey

13. T-shirt (men's), long sleeve, OU; cotton. Sire. S-Xt Gid.an G24co $ 13.95
Screenprint: 4color logo, w/-olor dept/title name (below) 'w/1 olor on
back"; Color: white, re¥y
14. T shat (mnen's), long sleeve, 100% cotton. Size: 2x 5X Gi'dan ,24n $ 14.9



B-2-25-3//uniform Apparel- Fire Rescue
Attachment - Prce Sheet.

Screenprint4 lor logo; w/lolor dept/utle name {below) w/1 color on
bak, Color: wtite, rey ---·---- --
15,ANFIK Tech Hood NO SUBSTITUTION Color: Navy, Red, Blah. Size X> ntek Tech hodv
Lulls«creer r 48.65,,
lb. ANIK ROAM TECH PANI 'NO SUBSTITUTION Co!or: tack ire 2838, mutek koam Teh Pant
aikscreen $ '53.15.-18 ANFTK Tehriran Burton Up"NOSUBSTITUTION" color: lack_and Ny Atek lechian Ba.ton U
Size Ly [mbraidery $s +61.25
19 All seasonJacket Port Authority 13z vortex waterproof3mn-1 Jacket Port Autiotiy 1332
'NO SUBSIIUIION" Navy and Red Embroidered both layer $ 99.65,___ --20. Sweatshirt w/zipper HO0DID, 50/50 Cotton/Polyester. Sze: S-KL: ChampionSIU
Embroidered. Multi-color loo {left chest);

$ 36.9
21. Sweatstrt w/zipper HOODED. 50/50 Cotton/Polyester. nae: 2X3x: Champion 800
Lmbrodered: Muiti-color loo $ 41.65
22. 1shirt {mer's}Dri-fit: Gil&an.o0 "no substitution Gt!dan&U00 $ 10.30
short slecve, 50/50 cotton /dry blend polyester jersey. size. s Xt : to substitutions
creenprint: 1color lopo; w/1cclor dept/utle name {above); w/1-color back
·hou!der Colot: Sport Grey, wlute
23. Thrt {men's)Dri-Fit: Gildan8000 "no substitution" Glidan8000 No $ 12 45
short sleeve, 50/50 cotton /dry blend polyester jersey. Size: 2X Ax substttution
Screenpnmnt: I color lopo; w/I-color dept/title name {above); w/1 color back
shoulder. Colors: Sport Grey, White
24. 1shirt (men's) Drifit. i.dnG0u0 $ 10.30
short sleeve, 50/50 cotton /dry bterd polyester jersey she: Large-Tall - 4XL-
tall

'Screen.pint: 1-color logo; w/Icolor dept/title name (above); w/!color back
p,,À4(4.a+ (z,y {]+,

25. T-shirt (men's) DriFit: Gildan8400 Gildan 8400 $ 13.15
'ong sleeve, 50/50 cotton /dry blend polyester jerey. Size. S - 2XI. Vo substitutions
Saeep:ut: 1olor kgo; w/1olor dept/tutle name (above); w/1color bac
shoulder._Colors: Navy, Sport Grey, White
2o. 4-shut (men's) Dri-Fit. Gildan G63400 $ 14.85
long sleeve, 5.5 ounce, 50/50 co:ton /poly. Size: 3XI 4XL
Screenp-int: 1-color lopo; w/1color dept/title name (above); w/1-color back.
Colors: Grey, white
21 T shirt (men's) Dri-Fit Portuttontv PC,SI 1 148



B-2-25-37/Unitorm Apparel - Fire Rescue
tachment A- Price Sheet..

long sleeve, 50/50 otton /dry blend polyester jersey. Size: LargeTali 3x1
tall
Sgenprit: Icolor loo, w/1color dept/title name (abve); w/1rlor back
Colors: Gey, wlute
98. i-snut (lades') Dri-Fit: Fort R& (Company 1PC' Port & orpany LU'SS te) 10 4
short leeve, 3.y ounce, 50/50otton /poly. Size; S XL substata:ton

Screvenprint: 1 or logo; w/1-color dept/title name (ubove}; w/l color bak.
I

Colors: Athletic Hesther, White
29.T smurt (lade) Dri-Fit: Port ± Compant LPC5 P'ont tUompany Le', Nor 3 12
short leeve, 0/50 cotton/dry blend poly. Size:. 2Xtxl substitutions
Screerprint: 1color logo; w/1color dept/tit!e name {above); w/1color back. I
Color: Athletic Heater, White
30 I-«hurt (ladies} Dri-Fit rrew or scoop nerk Team365 TI1IWL $ 12.75
ng sleeve, 50/50 cotton /dry blend polyester jersey. Sze:S- 2XL:
reenprmnt: 1-color logo; w/I-color dept/tute name {above}; w/1 color back
stulder._Colors: Grey, White
31.Thrt (ladles) Dr-fit: fcam 363 4;11wt $ 1.95
long sleeve, 5 ounce, 50/50 cotton /poly. ize: 3XI -4xl
reetupnut: 1olor loo; vu/l olor dept/title nare {above}; w/l olor ak.
Color: Grey.Whte ---
32. Nike Golf Tech Sport [Me') DriFit 7alo "no substitution Nike Gold Nech pr no $ 41.90
6%)1, 4color dept lopo embroidered, title embroidered ubstitton,

'Sze: Xarpe1al - 5XlreIall Colors: Anthracite, Black
33. Polo 5hurt w/buttons (men'): Part Authout KI0 no substitution Port Authority K100 No

sub,titution, $ 17.95
0/40 Cotton/Poiy
Size. 'S-Xt; Colors: Grap/rte
Embroiderv· íl color low/1 color dept/title are (above) w/1 color on
34. Polo Stt w/buttons {men's): Port Authority KI0 no substitution Port Au:hon+ty MIU) Ao

subs:ttutions $ 20.9
6O/40 Cotton/Poly
Sie: 2XI- 5XI; Colors: Graphite
fmbroidory: fullolor toy;o w/! color dept/tut'e name (above), 'w/1 color on
back
35. Polo Shur w/buttors {men's):. Port Authority HK1O "no substitution Port Auttouty iLK100

o substitution $ 20.55
60/40 Cotton/Poly



B-2-25-37/Unitorm Apparel- Fire Rescue
Attachment A- Price Sheet

"Se.LI-2XII, Colors: Graphite

fm'rodery: ful!-color logo w/I olur dept/tutle name (above), "w/l color on
tac8
3. 7olu Shirt w/button(me'): Punt Authority ILK!0) "no substitution Po:1 Authority 1HK1 $ 365
60/40 Cotton/Poly No subtitutions
Size: 3XL1 5XLT; Colors: Graphite
tmbrordzry: full-color logo w/I color dept/utle name [above), "w/1 color on
hack
37. Polo Shirt w/buttons (ladies): Port Authority Li00 no substitution Port Authority L10 No

substitutions $ 17.95
60/40 cotton/Poly I

i2e: S-XL; Colors: Graphite t

Embroidery. full-color too w/1 color dept/title name {above), "w/1 olor or !
back I

38. Polo Shirt w/buttons (lades). Port Authority K1o0 no substitution Port Auto!y !Où No ¡
subs4ntutions $ 20.,

60/40 Cotton/Poly
Se: 2Xt- 5XL ;lors: Graphite : I
Emry:tg:ye ful'color logo w/ color dept/title name {«tove), "w/1 color ou
bak" -----
39. Cornertone Polo CS410 no substitution .tner5ton» Pai (SA1

no u'sstitution $ 31.95
100% polyester, 6. ounce, 3 button lacket with dyed-tomath buttons, mnic
hips at enter placket and shoulders, reintorced dual pen pockets on left
sleeve

I[mbrodery: tul-olor lgo w/1 color dept/itle ame [above), "w/1 color ou
back' l
40, Cornerstone Polo CS410 no substitution Cornerstone Poto CA1ù ¢ 34.25
100polyester, 6.6 ounce, button placket with dyed-to-math buttons, mu no sustitution
cips at center placket and shoulders, reinforced dual pen pockets on lett
sleeve
Fmhrodery: full-rotor lopo w/I color dept/title name [above)
41. Cornerstone Polo TLC410 "no substitution Cornerstone Pol TL$Ao $ 3445
100% polyester, 6.6 ounce, 3 button piacet with dyedto-match turtors, mtc no su9stuton
chips at center placket and shoulders, reintorced dual pen pocket on left
sleeve
Embrgdery: fullcolor logo w/1 col dept/title name (a!ve), "v/1 colt on
baß



B-2-25-37/Uniform Apparel - Fire Resue
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42. oterstone Polo TLS410 no substitution Coinerstone Poto IS410 $ 31.70
100%polyester, 6.6 ounce, 3 button placket with dyed-to-match buttons, mvic tro ubti!aio
lips at enter placket and shoulders, reinforced dual pen pockets on 'ett
sleevr
fmbroidery: full-color loow/I color dept/itte name (above)

13. Cornerstone Polo CS412, a/l colors, size: men's S-XI, embroidery: full color Cornerstone Polo C5412 no
ogo (left chest), one olor name and title {right chest) substitution $ 31.85
44. Orner$tone Pl0 CS412, all colors, size: Men's 2XL-5XL; embroider: full wrnerstone Pol0 CS412 10

color log (left hest), one color name 2nd title (riht chest) substitution
.. $ 31.2

Correrstone Pulo TLCS1?
45. Cererstone Polo TLC$112 no substitution" no substitution $ 34.55
1û0% polyester, 6.b ounce, } button placket wtt dyed-to-match buttons, mi€

chps at enter placket and shoulders, reinforced dual pen pockets on left
sleeve
full color logo embroidered, title/name embroidered; Colors: Various, Size LI-
2x11
4. Cornerstone Polo H41? no substitution cornerstone Pol I41? $ 37.95
100% polyester, 6.6 ounce, 3 button placket with dyed-to-math buttons, mi no subtiution
clips at center placket and shoulders, reinforced dual pen pockets on h-tt
leeve
full-color ioo embroidered, title/name embroidered; Colors: vartouMe
3XLI -4x1I
17. Cornerstone Polo CS411, Color:various, sue. S XI, embroidery: full color ornerstone Polos41i
iogo {left chest), one color nam au title (itit hes) optional No substituto

$ 31.95
48., CornerStone Polo CS611, Colors: Various, size: Ladies 2XL-IXL; embroider: Cornerstone Polos Sd11
tull- color logo {ett chest), one color name and title (right chest) Optional No substitution

$ 34.25
49. Jacket: 100% polyester softshelt, zipper closure, water-resistant, zipper Core 363 88!84
pockets, vented back, machine washable. Color.Black Fmnbroirtery: Hr¡ multi
oior too lett chestbtack; BERu!side lettering embroidered on back of
liacket iwhite thread $ 57.65




