
Tabulation Of Bids
Event # : 136

Name: Commercial Diving Services

Description: The City of Fort Lauderdale, Florida (City) is seeking bids from qualified bidders, hereinafter referred to as the
Contractor, to provide commercial diving services for the repair of underwater pipes and structures. In
addition, the cleaning and inspection of portable water storage tanks, clearwells, recarbonation and aeration
basins and flumes for the City, in accordance with the terms, conditions, and specifications contained in this
Invitation to Bid (IFB).

Term: Initial 1-year contract with 3 one-year renewals
Supplier must bid on all item either from Group 1 (Lines 1-17) and/or Group 2 (Lines 18-37) to be considered
for an award.

Open Date: 10/11/2023 03:00:00 PM Close Date: 10/25/2023 02:00:00 PM

Event Currency: USD

Supplier Bid Amount

In Depth Inc 485,250.00

1473 Old Haw Creek Road
Bunnell, FL 32110

Industrial Divers
Corp.

253,000.00

2901 SW 3rd Avenue
STE #5
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33315

* * Supplier has responses with a no bid

KCDS 44,800.00

Po Box 19173
Topeka, KAN 66519

* * Supplier did not respond to all lines

Items
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Item: THREE DIVING CREW SCHEDULED RATE
Description: THREE DIVING CREW SCHEDULED RATE

Long Item
Description:

Three Diver Team scheduled rate at a per hour cost - Monday through Friday from 7:00 am to 6:00 pm.

The City estimates an annual usage of 60 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 60.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 60.0000 405.00000000 24,300.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 60.0000 375.00000000 22,500.00

Item: RATE FOR NIGHTS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAY
Description: THREE DIVING CREW SCHEDULED RATE FOR NIGHTS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAY

Long Item
Description:

Three Diving crew for scheduled service for night shift (6.01pm to 6.59am) and for weekends (Sat 6:59 am- Mon
6:59am)/holidays (12 am - 11.59pm).

The City estimates an annual usage of 60 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 60.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 60.0000 635.00000000 38,100.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 60.0000 487.50000000 29,250.00

Item:  DIVING CREW UNSCHEDULED RATE
Description: THREE DIVING CREW UNSCHEDULED RATE

Long Item
Description:

This rate is for unscheduled service (2 hour response time) 24 hours/day, 7 days/week, 365days/year.

The City estimates an annual usage of 60 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 60.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 60.0000 955.00000000 57,300.00
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Industrial Divers Corp. 60.0000 525.00000000 31,500.00

Item: FOUR DIING CREW SCHEDULED RATE
Description: FOUR DIING CREW SCHEDULED RATE

Long Item
Description:

This rate is for unscheduled service (2 hour response time) 24 hours/day, 7 days/week, 365days/year.

The City estimates an annual usage of 60 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 40.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 495.00000000 19,800.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 500.00000000 20,000.00

KCDS 40.0000 350.00000000 14,000.00

Item: RATE FOR NIGHTS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAY
Description: FOUR DIVER CREW SCHEDULED RATE FOR NIGHTS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAYS

Long Item
Description:

Four Diving Crew for scheduled service for night shift (6.01pm to 6.59am) and for weekends (Sat 6:59 am- Mon
6:59am)/holidays (12 am - 11.59pm).

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 40.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 745.00000000 29,800.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 650.00000000 26,000.00

Item: CREWS UNSCHEDULED RATE
Description: FOUR DIVER CREWS UNSCHEDULED RATE

Long Item
Description:

This rate is for unscheduled service (2 hour response time) 24 hours/day, 7 days/week, 365days/year.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of HR Quantity: 40.0000
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Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 1,125.00000000 45,000.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 700.00000000 28,000.00

Item: HYDRAULIC ROUGH TERRAIN CRANE
Description: HYDRAULIC ROUGH TERRAIN CRANE

Long Item
Description:

Hydraulic Rough Terrain crane, Link Belt HSP8015 or equal. All costs associated with using this item including
Mobilization/demobilization must be included in the hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

DA Quantity: 5.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 5.0000 5,500.00000000 27,500.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 5.0000 1,400.00000000 7,000.00

Item:  DISCHARGING HOSE
Description: 4" HYDRAULIC PUMP 400' DISCHARGING HOSE

Long Item
Description:

4" hydraulic Pump 400' discharging hose. All costs associated with using this item including
mobilization/demobilization must be included in the hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 40.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 155.00000000 6,200.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 100.00000000 4,000.00

Item: DISCHARGING HOSE
Description: 6" HYDRAULIC PUMP WITH 400' DISCHARGING HOSE
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Long Item
Description:

6" Hydraulic Pump (with 400' of discharge hose). All costs associated with using this item including
mobilization/demobilization must be included in the hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 40.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 300.00000000 12,000.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 200.00000000 8,000.00

Item: VACUUM TRUCK
Description: VACUUM TRUCK

Long Item
Description:

Vacuum Truck,  3200 Gallon. All costs associated with using this item including Mobilization/demobilization  must
be included in the hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 40.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 625.00000000 25,000.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 450.00000000 18,000.00

Item: CONSTRUCTION PLATFORM WITH BOBCA
Description: FLOATING CONSTRUCTION PLATFORM WITH BOBCAT E35I OR EQUAL

Long Item
Description:

Floating construction platform with Bobcat E35i or Equal. All costs associated with using this item including
Mobilization/demobilization must be included in the hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

DA Quantity: 5.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 5.0000 4,100.00000000 20,500.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 5.0000 2,500.00000000 12,500.00
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Item: FLOATING STORAGE PLATFORM
Description: FLOATING STORAGE PLATFORM WITH MINIMUM 4 CY CAPACITY

Long Item
Description:

Floating Storage Platform with minimum 4 CY capacity. All fees associated with using this item including
Mobilization/demobilization  must be included in the hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 40.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 315.00000000 12,600.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 375.00000000 15,000.00

Item: LONG STICK EXCAVATOR
Description: LONG STICK EXCAVATOR CAT 325 OR EQUAL

Long Item
Description:

Long Stick Excavator, CAT 325 or equal. All costs associated with using this item including
Mobilization/demobilization must be included in the hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

DA Quantity: 5.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 5.0000 7,500.00000000 37,500.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 5.0000 2,500.00000000 12,500.00

Item: TURBIDITY BARRIER FDOT 104-11
Description: TURBIDITY BARRIER FDOT 104-11

Long Item
Description:

Turbidity Barrier, FDOT 104-11. All costs associated with using this item including Mobilization/demobilization must
be included in the hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 40.0000
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 100.00000000 4,000.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 75.00000000 3,000.00

Item: CLOSED CIRCUIT VIDEO SYSTEM
Description: CLOSED CIRCUIT VIDEO SYSTEM WITH DVD COPY

Long Item
Description:

Closed Circuit Video System with DVD copy.

The City estimates an annual usage of 20 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 20.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 20.0000 125.00000000 2,500.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 20.0000 62.50000000 1,250.00

Item: HYDRAULIC TOOLS
Description: HYDRAULIC TOOLS

Long Item
Description:

Hydraulic Tools. All costs associated with using this item including Mobilization/demobilization must be included in
the hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.

Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 40.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 100.00000000 4,000.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 87.50000000 3,500.00

Item: PUSH BOATS
Description: PUSH BOATS

Long Item
Description:

Push Boats. All costs associated with using this item including Mobilization/demobilization must be included in the
hourly rate quoted.

The City estimates an annual usage of 40 hours. However, quantities listed are not indicative of future usage.
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Unit of
Measure:

HR Quantity: 40.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 40.0000 250.00000000 10,000.00

Industrial Divers Corp. 40.0000 275.00000000 11,000.00

Item: FIVEASH TANK #1
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE TANK 28"28" ROOF HATCH  MANWAYS

Long Item
Description:

Please refer to attached spreadsheet (Fiveash tank #1) for more details and specifications.

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 11,000.00000000 11,000.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 2,200.00000000 2,200.00

Item: FIVEASH TANK #2
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE TANK 55"48"ROOF HATCH 2 MANWAYS 186X32

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Five ash tank #2

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 9,500.00000000 9,500.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 2,600.00000000 2,600.00

Item: PEELE DIXIE SOUTH TANK
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE TANK 35"X44" ROOF HATCH 2 MANWAYS 4MIL GA
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Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Peele Dixie South Tank

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 9,500.00000000 9,500.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 2,600.00000000 2,600.00

Item: PEELE DIXIE NORTH TANK
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE TANK 35"X44" ROOFHATCH 2 MANWAYS 4MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Peele Dixie North Tank

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 9,500.00000000 9,500.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 2,200.00000000 2,200.00

Item: POINCIANA PARK
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE TANK ROOF HATCH  2 MANWAYS 2MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Poinciana Park

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 6,300.00000000 6,300.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 2,600.00000000 2,600.00
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Item: SECOND AVENUE
Description: ELEVATED WELDED STEEL 24X24 ROOF HATCH 1 MANWAY 1MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Second Avenue

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,350.00000000 3,350.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 2,600.00000000 2,600.00

Item: FIVE ASH CLEARWELL #1
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE 3 HATCHES NO LADDER 0.98MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Five Ash Clearwell # 1

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 6,300.00000000 6,300.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 2,400.00000000 2,400.00

Item: FIVE ASH CLEARWELL #2
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE 1 HATCH NO LADDER 0.49M

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Five Ash Clearwell #2

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 4,500.00000000 4,500.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 136: Commercial Diving Services

September 23, 2024 Page 10



Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

KCDS 1.0000 1,600.00000000 1,600.00

Item: FIVE ASH CLEARWELL # 3
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE 2 HATCH NO LADDERS 0.17MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Five Ash Clearwell #3

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,750.00000000 3,750.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 1,600.00000000 1,600.00

Item: FIVE ASH CLEARWELL #4
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE 1 HATCH 0.17MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Five Ash Clearwell #4

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 4,500.00000000 4,500.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 1,600.00000000 1,600.00

Item: FIVE ASH CLEARWELL # 5
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE 2 HATCH 0.37MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Five Ash Clearwell #5

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,350.00000000 3,350.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 1,600.00000000 1,600.00

Item: FIVE ASH CLEARWELL #6
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE 4 HATCH 0.31MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Five Ash Clearwell #6

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,350.00000000 3,350.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 800.00000000 800.00

Item: FIVE ASH CLEARWELL #7
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE 1 HATCH 0.05MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Five Ash Clearwell #7

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,150.00000000 3,150.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 800.00000000 800.00

Item: PEELE DIXIE CLEARWELL #8
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE 3 HATCH 0.18MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Peele Dixie Clearwell #8
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Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,350.00000000 3,350.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 800.00000000 800.00

Item: RECARBONATION BASIN #1/2
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE open 0.121MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Decarbonation Basin #1/2

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,150.00000000 3,150.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 800.00000000 800.00

Item: RECARBONATION BASIN #3
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE open 0.181MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Recarbonation Basin # 3

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,150.00000000 3,150.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 800.00000000 800.00

Item: RECARBONATION BASIN #4
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Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE open 0.181MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Recarbonation Basin # 4

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,150.00000000 3,150.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 800.00000000 800.00

Item: ON GROUND CONCRETE OPEN  FLUMES
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE open  FLUMES VARIES

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for Flumes

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 12,000.00000000 12,000.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 800.00000000 800.00

Item: SOUTH AERATION BASIN
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE open BASIN 0.177MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for South Aeration Basin

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,150.00000000 3,150.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 800.00000000 800.00
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Item: NORTH AERATION BASIN
Description: ON GROUND CONCRETE open BASIN 0.177MG

Long Item
Description:

See attached spreadsheet for details and specifications for North Aeration Basin

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

In Depth Inc 1.0000 3,150.00000000 3,150.00

Industrial Divers Corp. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

KCDS 1.0000 800.00000000 800.00
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