From: chrisharveycredit@gmail.com

To: Eloizin, Rachelle; "moccs95"
Subject: RE: Mount Olive Missionary Baptist Church - CRA Funding Agreement
Date: Thursday, January 20, 2022 7:42:22 AM

**Please be cautious**
This email originated from outside of The City of Delray Beach. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good morning Rachelle. We have been going through some challenges in gathering the necessary
documentation to fulfill the requirements of this program. Our beloved Pastor is still experiencing
the effects of a personal tragedy and therefore has not been able to coordinate this process. He
asked that | pass along this request to extend the deadline to 3/20/2022.

Respectfully,

Chris Harvey

From: Eloizin, Rachelle <EloizinR@mydelraybeach.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 19, 2022 4:46 PM

To: Chris Harvey <chrisharveycredit@gmail.com>; moccs95 <moccs95@bellsouth.net>
Subject: Mount Olive Missionary Baptist Church - CRA Funding Agreement
Importance: High

Good afternoon, Chris,

Thank you for speaking to me today regarding the upcoming funding agreement termination date.
You mentioned requesting an extension. Please reply with specifics of what the challenges are to close
out this project by the January 20, 2022, termination date. It would be great to have that before the

end of the week for consideration of an extension.

I was able to reach Ms. Castello regarding the pending items to close out the agreement. She said she

has a few items she will be scanning and have forwarded to me from you.

Reminder of the items needed to close out the agreement and process reimbursement.
1. Images of the finished work
2. Invoices for painting and signage services
3. W9 for any vendors submitted
4. Proof of payment which includes:
-receipt if paid by card or

-image of check used for payment/ bank statement showing check number
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Feel free to contact me with any further questions.

Thank you,

Rachelle Eloizin
Community Liaison

Delray Beach Community Redevelopment

| Facebook | Instagram | Delraycra.org

DELRAY BEACH CRA

COMMUNITY REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY

20 North Swinton Avenue
Delray Beach, Florida 33444
Phone: 561-276-8640

Fax: 561-276-8558
www.delraycra.org

PUBLIC RECORDS NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or from
local officials, employees, or the general public regarding city business are public records available to the public
and media upon request. Your e-mail communications may therefore be subject to public disclosure.
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