From: Naiem, Adham

To: Pereira, Richard

Cc: Williams, Mya; Aubery, Sabrina; Oaikhena, Henry; Kennedy, Leos
Subject: LFA for FM# 438394-1-52-02

Date: Thursday, February 17, 2022 4:52:18 PM

Attachments: image001.png

RE Additional Funds for Homewood Blvd. Proiect FM# 438394-1-52-01.msa

**Please be cautious**

This email originated from outside of The City of Delray Beach. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Good Morning Richard,

This email is to inform you and the City of Delray Beach an explanation of the sequences and funding
for the FM# 438394-1: Homewood Boulevard from Old Germantown Road to Lowson Boulevard.

FM# 438394-1-52-01: refers to the FDOT funded portion of the project and all costs associated with
the originally programmed improvements

FM# 438394-1-52-02: refers to the city funded portion of the project and all costs associated per the
signed local funding agreement.

To Further Clarify:

Total Project Cost: $ 2,505,477.79
FDOT Portion: $1,207,887.79
City of Delray Portion: $1,297,590.00 ($ 901,039.00 on deposit + $330,349.00 additional requested)

Any costs referred to in the local funding agreement and any amendments thereafter refer solely to
the city funded portion of the project and do not represent the FM# 438394-1-52-01: FDOT funded
portion of the project.

Thanks,

Adham Naiem, P.E., LEED Green Associate
Project Manager- Roadway Design Section 6
District 4 FDOT

3400 West Commercial Boulevard

Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33309-3421

Email: adham.naiem@dot.state.fl.us

Phone: (954) 777-4440

UConn Alumnus

FDOT)
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RE: Additional Funds for Homewood Blvd. Project, FM# 438394-1-52-01

		From

		Kennedy, Leos

		To

		Pereira, Richard; Naiem, Adham

		Recipients

		pereirar@mydelraybeach.com; Adham.Naiem@dot.state.fl.us



Richard, 



 



Attached please find the revised request and invoice for additional funds.  Please forward said invoice to the City’s Accounts Payable Department to start the wire transfer process.



 



If you have any questions and/or concerns, don ‘t hesitate to contact me or the Project Manager. 



 



Thank you and have a good one. 



 



 



Leos A. Kennedy, Jr., FCCM



(Leos. Leo with an “s”, not LEO)



Florida Department of Transportation 



Program Management Unit



3400 W. Commercial Blvd. 



Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309



954-777-2285



Leos.Kennedy@dot.state.fl.us



Schedule M-F 8:00 am to 4:30 pm



Lunch M-F: 1:30 pm to 2:00 pm



 



 



From: Kennedy, Leos 
Sent: Thursday, June 10, 2021 8:18 AM
To: Pereira, Richard <pereirar@mydelraybeach.com>; Naiem, Adham <Adham.Naiem@dot.state.fl.us>
Cc: D4-Work Program <D4-WorkProgram@dot.state.fl.us>; Oaikhena, Henry <Henry.Oaikhena@dot.state.fl.us>; Williams, Mya <Mya.Williams@dot.state.fl.us>; Aubery, Sabrina <Sabrina.Aubery@dot.state.fl.us>
Subject: Additional Funds for Homewood Blvd. Project, FM# 438394-1-52-01
Importance: High



 



Richard,



 



The Department has received the bids for the Homewood project referenced above. It has been determined the City will need to furnish the Department additional funds to construct the project. 



Please see the attached request and invoice for additional funds.  Please forward said invoice to the City’s Accounts Payable Department to start the wire transfer process.



 



If you have any questions and/or concerns, don ‘t hesitate to contact me or the Project Manager. 



 



Thank you and have a good one. 



 



 



Leos A. Kennedy, Jr., FCCM



Florida Department of Transportation 



Program Management Unit



3400 W. Commercial Blvd. 



Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309



954-777-2285



Leos.Kennedy@dot.state.fl.us



Schedule M-F 8:00 am to 4:30 pm



Lunch M-F: 1:30 pm to 2:00 pm



 



 





Invoice for additional funds revised 11-23-2021.pdf

DocuSign Envelope ID: 0B37C0B4-D56B-4F9D-BF05-308422F1DA1D

Florida Department of Transportation
RON DESANTIS 3400 West Commercial Boulevard KEVIN J. THIBAULT, P.E.
GOVERNOR Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309 SECRETARY

November 23, 2021

To:Accounts Payable Department
City of Delray Beach
100 N.W. 1%t Avenue
Delray Beach, Florida 33444

RE: LOCALLY FUNDED AGREEMENT
State FM No. 438394-1-52-02
Culvert widening, construction (install) of mast arm signal, pavement
marking and signing during the Department’s construction (bike lane
and sidewalk) work along Homewood Boulevard from Old Germantown
Road to Lowson Boulevard in Palm Beach County

INVOICE # 001- Revised

The City of Delray has agreed to pay the Florida Department of Transportation for
additional funding required to construct the Project, in accordance with the Locally
Funded Agreement, paragraph No. 4B dated October 8th, 2020, in the sum of
THREE HUNDRED THIRTY THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED FORTY NINE
DOLLARS AND NO CENTS:

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE: $330,349.00

It is imperative that the Department receive the funds in the amount of $330,349.00
by December 1, 2021. As per the Agreement, if the PARTICIPANT cannot provide
the additional deposit within fourteen (14) calendar days, a letter must be
submitted to and approved by the DEPARTMENT’s Project Manager indicating the
date the deposit will be made and the DEPARTMENT’s written consent to the
payment of the additional deposit on said date. The PARTICIPANT understands
the request and approval of the additional time could delay the Project, and
additional costs at the PARTICPANT’s expense may be incurred due to delay of
the Project. In the event of non-payment, the DEPARTMENT reserves the right to
terminate this Agreement.

Improve Safety, Enhance Mobility, Inspire Innovation
www.fdot.gov







DocuSign Envelope ID: 0B37C0B4-D56B-4F9D-BF05-308422F1DA1D

Please send the additional funding to the Department as instructed below.
Wire transfer/Payments are to be made to:

Wells Fargo Bank, N.A.

Account # 4834783896

ABA # 121000248

Chief Financial Officer of Florida

Re: DOT - K 11-78, Financial project #438394-1-52-02

In order for FDOT to receive credit for the funds due to the Department, the
reference line must contain “FDOT” and an abbreviated purpose, financial project
number or LFA account number.

Sincerely,

DocuSigned by:

Sabrina lubury

2B6C5A6F23CE493...

Sabrina Aubery
District Program Administration Engineer
District Four

Copy: Adham Naiem, Project Manager
File

Improve Safety, Enhance Mobility, Inspire Innovation
www.fdot.gov















Request for additional funds revised 11-23-21.pdf

Florida Department of Transportation

RICK SCOTT 3400 West Commercial Blvd. JIM BOXOLD
GOVERNOR Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309 SECRETARY

November 19, 2021
Mr. Richard Pereira
City of Delray Beach
434 S. Swinton Avenue
Delray Beach, Florida 33444

RE: Locally Funded Agreement (LFA)- revised
FM Number: 438394-1-52-02
Description: Culvert widening, construction (install) of mast arm signal, pavement marking

and signing during the Department’s construction (bike lane and sidewalk) work
along Homewood Boulevard from Old Germantown Road to Lowson Boulevard
in Palm Beach County

Dear Mr. Pereira:

A Locally Funded Agreement (LFA) was executed with the City of Delray Beach on October 8th, 2020.
According to Paragraph 4B of said agreement, the Department will notify the Participant (City of Delray
Beach) as soon as it becomes apparent the accepted bid amount plus allowances is in excess of the advance
deposit amount.

The project bids were received and opened on May 26, 2021. The apparent lowest bid for FM# 438394-
1-52-02 is $1,297,590.00. The amount currently on deposit is $901,039.00, thus leaving a shortfall of
funding in the amount of $330,349.00.

It is imperative that the Department receive the funds in the amount of $330,349.00 by December 1, 2021
to ensure the culvert widening, construction (install) of mast arm signal, pavement markings and signing
is installed during the Department’s bike lanes and sidewalk construction work. Please have the funds
wired as instructed below:

Wire transfer/Payments are to be made to:

Wells Fargo Bank, N.A.

Account # 4834783896

ABA # 121000248

Chief Financial Officer of Florida

Re: DOT - K 11-78, Financial project #438394-1-52-02

In order for FDOT to receive credit for the funds due to the Department,
the reference line must contain “FDOT” and an abbreviated purpose,
financial project number or LFA account number.

Improve Safety, Enhance Mobility, Inspire Innovation
www.fdot.gov







Thank you for your cooperation and if you have questions, please do not hesitate to contact me at 954-777-
2285.

Sincerely,

Leos A. Kennedy, Jr.

Program Management Office
District Four

Copy: Adham Naiem, Project Manager
Eduardo Caballero, WPBch Ops Constr. Proj. Mgr.

Deborah Ihsan, Asst. Distr. Constr. Eng.
File










