Janitorial Supplies
City of Delray Beach
BID No. 2016-014

Description All American Poly Amchgm ! P_oly Coastal Wipers o Pac_kagmg Lavcor LLC NEITED Seeis Supply Works
International Corporation Corporation Formulas
1 [36' Niffy Nabber Extension Arm with Claw No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 39.15 No Bid | ¢ 16.11
2 _|Air Freshener No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.40
3 |Air Freshener- Febreez No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 4.45 No Bid 2.40
4 | Air Freshener- Misty (Own Label) No Bid | $ 43.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 5.40 No Bid 2.70
Bayberry Sent Off Insect Repellent- Off Brand
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 7.10 No Bid | $ 3.32
6 |Big Belly Bags- Item No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 |Biohazard Bags/THF No Bid | $ 121.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 57.00 No Bid | $ 9.72
8 [Bleach No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 1048 | $ 10.40 No Bid | $ 10.92
9 |Bowl Brushes- Unisan No Bid | $ 1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 0.90
10 [Bowl Cleaner- Bowlex No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 3.50 No Bid | $ 1.16
11 [Brooms- Unisan No Bid | $ 84.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 15.68 No Bid | $ 6.89
12 |Cascade No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 3.14
13 [C-Fold No Bid | $ 22.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 18.27
Class 2 Economy Reflective Hi-Vis Traffic
14 |Safety Vest No Bid | $ 5.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 17.90 No Bid 8.05
15 |Clorox Wiper (160) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 16.25 No Bid 28.39
16 [Comet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.12
17 [Coreless Toilet Paper No Bid | $ 53.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.40 No Bid 1.05
18 [Dakura Polarized Lens Safety Glasses No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37.40 No Bid 19.84
19 [Dawn No Bid | $ 41.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 69.55 No Bid 29.52
20 |Doggie Waste Bags- (Makes their own) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 |Ear Plugs- 3M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.08
22 |Ear Plugs- 3M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.08
23 |Facial Tissue No Bid No Bid | $ 14.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 17.10
24 |Febreeze No Bid | $ 53.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.96
25 |Fire Ant and Roach Killer- (Own Label) No Bid | $ 71.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.45
26 _|Fire Ant Injector- Misty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.78
27 |Foam Disinfect Cleaner 12 oz No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 26.64
Foam Up Antibacterial Soap (Own Label)
28 11000 ml No Bid | $ 59.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 25.00 No Bid
29 |Foamee Cleaner- Own label No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 83.00 | $ 20.76
30 |Furniture Polish No Bid | $ 41.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 28.68
Garbage Bags 24" x 33" Clear High Density 6
31 |Mic Refuse Weight Can Liner 15 Gallon $ 46.07 [ $ 2295 | $ 12.60 No Bid | $ 14.34 No Bid No Bid | $ 10.00
Garbage Bags 40" x 46" Black Low Density
32 |1.50 Mil XX Heavy Can Liner 45 Gallon $ 1237 | $ 40.00 [ $ 15.90 No Bid | $ 9.18 No Bid No Bid | $ 20.00
33 [Glass Cleaner Aerosol No Bid | $ 24.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 16.44
34 |Glass Cleaner- Klear view- (Own Label) No Bid | $ 48.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 1.37
36 |[Graffiti Remover- Sparta No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 5.17
37 |Gray Lens Safety Glasses No Bid | $ 2.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 1.49
38 |Grill Brick 8 IN. X 4 IN. X 3-1/2 IN. BLACK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 18.00
39 |Grill Brushes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 1.09
Hand Cleanser - LUXURY FOAM 1000ML
40 |FRAGRANCE/DYE FREE No Bid | $ 52.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 25.00 | $ 35.94
Hand Cleanser Luxury Foam Fragrance and
41 |Dye Free Skin Cleanser - 1000 ml Refill No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 25.00 | $ 38.10
42 [Hand soap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 85.00 | $ 16.64
Handle truck brush 60 IN. THREADED 15/16
43 |IN. DIAMETER No Bid | $ 54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 21.96
44 |Heavy Duty Gloves (3M) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 1.23
45 |Insect Fogger- Jet Force No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 4.93
46 |Insect Repellant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 3.32
Large Size Plastic Dot String Knit Work
47 |Gloves No Bid | $ 5.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 0.83
48 |Soap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 85.00 No Bid
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49 |Lotion Soap- Kutol 800 ml No Bid | § 64.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 [Lysol - Fresh Scent No Bid 81.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.24

51 [Lysol - Original Scent No Bid 84.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.24

52 |[Mop Heads- Unisan No Bid 99.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.16

53 |Napkins -Reliable No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 39.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nitrile Gloves- Renown LARGE, POWDER-

54 |FREE, No Bid | $ 5140 | $ 40.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 12.20

55 [Oven Cleaner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 85.00 | $ 23.88
Paper Towels- Renowan 2-PLY PAPER

56 |TOWELS, WHITE, 6.92X12.00 IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 3.88
Paper Towels White 1-Ply Controlled Roll

57 [Towel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 19.02

58 |Paper Towels No Bid | $ 54.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 23.29

59 |Pine Cleaner 1 Gallon No Bid | $ 35.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 22.28

60 |Pinesol No Bid | $ 35.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 16.71

61 |Pinesol 144 oz No Bid | $ 35.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 16.71
Plastic Bag 10 gal., Dimensions: 15"W x 9"D x

62 [24"L, 1.0, Color: Black $ 16.74 | $ 48.75 [ $ 20.80 No Bid | $ 6.98 No Bid No Bid | $ 5.60
Plastic Bag 20-30 gal., Dimensions: 16"W x

63 |14"D x 37"L, 4.0, Color: Black $ 1037 | $ 3324 | $ 24.90 No Bid | $ 11.82 No Bid No Bid | $ 13.10
Plastic Bag 56 gal., Dimensions: 22"W x 16"D

64 |x 60"L, 2.0, Color: Black $ 21.32 3324 | % 21.00 No Bid | $ 12.72 No Bid No Bid 13.59

65 |Plastic Drinking Cups - Galaxy (70z.) No Bid 47.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37.80

66 |Purell No Bid 47.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.88

67 |RENOWN Soap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.84

68 [Roll Towel | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.53

69 |Roll Towel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.13
Rubber Palm Gloves Coated Gray Work

70 [Gloves No Bid | $ 24.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 20.76
Shop Rags WYPALL X60 LT WT BRAG BOX

71 |WIPER 12.5"X16.8 WHITE No Bid | $ 16.20 No Bid | $ 45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 12.78

72 |Shredder Bags No Bid No Bid | $ 27.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

73 |Shredder Bags No Bid No Bid | $ 27.00 No Bid | $ 10.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Simple Green All Purpose Industrial Cleaner &

74 |Degreaser No Bid | $ 69.95 No Bid NoBid | $ 53.04 No Bid No Bid | $ 48.16

75 [Solo Drinking Cups (70z.) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 0.01

76 |Sponges No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 13.20

77 _|Stainless Steel Cleaner No Bid | $ 34.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 85.00 | $ 29.52

78 |Stainless Steel Scrubber 1.75 OZ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 16.20

79 |Styrofoam Cups No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 0.01

80 |Tilex - Mildew Remover No Bid | $ 32.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 14.94

81 |Tilex - Scum Remover 32 oz Spray Bottle No Bid | $ 29.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 17.55

82 |Toilet Bowl Cleaner No Bid | $ 34.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 13.92

83 |Toilet Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 2.03

84 |Toilet Paper - White 2-Ply Jr Jumbo No Bid | $ 22.00 | $ 26.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 19.20
Toilet Paper 2-PLY CONTROLLED-USE
BATH TISSUE WITH OPTICORE®, WHITE,

85 |3-3/4X4 IN., 865 SHEETS PER ROLL No Bid | $ 53.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 40.83
Toilet Paper- Eco Soft 2-PLY, 2,000 FT. PER

86 |ROLL No Bid | $ 23.60 | $ 26.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 23.56

87 |Toilet Seat Covers No Bid No Bid | $ 31.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 5.20

88 |Toilet Tissue- (Own Label) No Bid | $ 22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 4.32

89 |Trigger Spray Bottles (16 0z.) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 155($ 0.48
Truck Brush VEHICLE BRUSH FLO-THRU

90 |FLAGGED 10 INCH No Bid | $ 12.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 9.39
Urinal screen CLEAN BREEZE, WITH NON-

91 |PARA BLOCK No Bid | $ 19.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 9.18

92 |Urinal/ Toilet Cleaner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 85.00 | $ 1.45
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93 |Urinal Cakes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.41
94 |Vinegar DISTILLED WHITE 5% GALLON No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.44
95 |Windex 32 oz spray No Bid | $ 61.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.61
96 |Wipes No Bid | $ 59.95 No Bid | $ 33.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.04
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