
CHEMICAL (CO-OP) BID
CITY OF DELRAY BEACH

BID NO 2016-018

BID OPENING: 11/09/2015   POSTED: 11/10/2015

EST. ANNUAL 
USAGE UNIT SIZE

Diamond R 
Fertilizer Golf Ventures Helena Chemical 

Co ProSource One SiteOne 
Landscape Supply

Univar USA, 
INC.

6 AQUATHOL SUPER K 4360 LBS NO BID NO BID 16.95$                  17.10$               NO BID 19.69$              
34 LEMWET 150 GALS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 RODEO 140 220 GALS 16.60$             19.00$                17.25$                  20.42$               24.67$                 NO BID
67 TRIMEC PLUS                                         250 GALS NO BID 102.25$              NO BID NO BID 113.88$                NO BID
58 SEVIN 80 WSP                           65 LBS 44.80$             NO BID NO BID NO BID 41.12$                 NO BID
87 AQUASTAR 200 GALS 16.60$             NO BID 18.00$                  NO BID 24.67$                 NO BID
94 CLEARYS 3336+ 150 GALS 53.70$             58.05$                108.00$                NO BID 101.00$                NO BID

101 TALSTAR 0.069% 
BIFENTHRIN

1000 GALS 31.35$             NO BID NO BID 28.50$               0.18$                   29.59$              

102 SAFARI 20 SG SYSTEMIC 
INSECTICIDE W/ 
DINOTEFURAN

100 LBS 98.00$             94.00$                109.33$                103.38$             112.89$                118.32$            
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