ITB No. 2018-038

Road Construction Materials
# of Bidders: 1

GROUP A: ROAD MATERIALS - ASPHALTS

Austin Tupler Trucking, Inc.

Austin Tupler Trucking, Inc.

ftem Estimated Unit Pick-up Unit Total Delivered Unit Total
Qty. Price (Est Qty X Pick-up Unit Price) Price (Est Qty X Delivered Unit Price)

1 Type S-1 Asphalt 310 tons No Bid No Bid
2 Type Il Asphalt 1,700 tons No Bid No Bid
3 Type Ill Asphalt 5,010 tons No Bid No Bid
4 Cold Patch Asphalt 585 tons No Bid No Bid
5 Tac Oil, RC#70 3,145 gals No Bid No Bid
6 E::cdhy Road Repair Permanent Cold 300 gals No Bid No Bid
7 Permanent Cold Patch, 55 Ib. pail 200 pails No Bid No Bid
8 59 Ib. bag of Ready Conrete Mix 549 bags No Bid No Bid
9 Reclaimed asphalt millings 55 tons No Bid No Bid

TOTAL|

GROUP B: ROAD MATERIALS - NON-ASPHALTS
Austin Tupler Trucking, Inc. Austin Tupler Trucking, Inc.
ltem Estimated Unit Pick-up Unit Total Delivered Unit Total
Qty. Price (Est Qty X Pick-up Unit Price) Price (Est Qty X Delivered Unit Price)

1 Crushed Coarse Lime rock 1,500 tons S 9.75|$ 14,625.00 S 18.75|$ 28,125.00
2 Pit Run Shell Rock 1,000 tons $ 9.50 | $ 9,500.00 $ 2150 $ 21,500.00
3 Drainfield Rock 3/4" 750 tons S 16.55 | $ 12,412.50 S 2420 (S 18,150.00
4 Best Mason Sand 100 tons S 15.00 | $ 1,500.00 S 35.00 | $ 3,500.00
5 Clean Fill Dirt 250 yards $ 825|$ 2,062.50 $ 19.75 | $ 4,937.50
6 Precast Car Bumpers w/pins 475 each No Bid No Bid
7 Crushed Recycled Concrete 5,000 cubic yards| $ 15.00 | $ 75,000.00 S 23.00 | S 115,000.00
8 DOT Crush Rock - non certified 1,600 tons S 9.75|$ 15,600.00 S 18.75|$ 30,000.00
9 #57 Rock 300 tons $ 16.55 [ $ 4,965.00 $ 2420 S 7,260.00
10 Concrete, 300 pump mix with fiber 1,100 cubic yards | No Bid No Bid
11 Stabilizer Rock 100 tons $ 7.15|$ 715.00 $ 15.65 | $ 1,565.00
12 Compactable Fill Sand 100 yards S 8.25|$ 825.00 S 1975 | $ 1,975.00
13 Code 01 Lime Rock (double crushed) 1,500 tons S 11.25|$ 16,875.00 S 2025 | S 30,375.00
14 #4 Ballast Rock 500 tons $ 16.55 [ $ 8,275.00 $ 2420$ 12,100.00
15 #5 Ballast Rock 500 tons $ 16.55 [ $ 8,275.00 $ 2420 S 12,100.00

TOTAL S 170,630.00 S 286,587.50

Posted: 4/18/18




