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Majtenyi, Victor

From: Lugo, Ralph
Sent: Wednesday, January 8, 2020 3:41 PM
To: Majtenyi, Victor
Cc: Magloire, Alicia
Subject: FW: 12” WM Relocation at SE 911 Federal Hwy., Delray Beach

Vic, 
Please see below, Fabio from FDOT stated the work is satisfactorily completed. We can move forward with the payment 
balance now. 
 
 

Thank You 
 

RalphLugo       
 
Manager of Water/Sewer Network 
                                                              

 
 

 
Swinton Operations Complex 
434 S. Swinton Ave., Delray Beach, FL 33444 
| 561.243.7309 | lugor@mydelraybeach.com  

 
 

 
SEMPER FIDELIS 
 

 
 

PUBLIC RECORDS NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law. Most written communications to or from 
local officials, employees, or the general public regarding city business are public records available to the 
public and media upon request. Your e‐mail communications may therefore be subject to public disclosure 
 
 
 

From: Alvarez, Fabio <Fabio.Alvarez@ferrovialservices.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 8, 2020 3:21 PM 
To: Lugo, Ralph <lugor@mydelraybeach.com> 
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Cc: rheller@johnsondavis.com 
Subject: 12” WM Relocation at SE 911 Federal Hwy., Delray Beach 
 
Mr. Lugor, 
 
I was contacted by Mr. Heller from Johnson Davis to confirm that the subject emergency permit work was satisfactorily 
completed. Please use this e‐mail to confirm that subject emergency repair work was inspected by our Permits Inspector 
Otto Elmer and he indicated that it met all requirements. 
 
 
Thank‐you, 
 
Fabio Alvarez 
Operations Manager 
Port Miami Tunnel 
C: +1 954 419 8954  
Fabio.Alvarez@FerrovialServices.com 
 
www.ferrovialservices.com 

 

--------------------------------------------------------- 
Twitter - Facebook - LinkedIn - Blog 
 

 
 
"This email and any attachments are confidential and are for the intended addressee[s] only. Unauthorised use of this 
communication is prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender and remove 
them from your system. Confidentiality is not waived or lost by reason of the mistaken delivery to you. Before opening 
or using any attachments, it is your responsibility to check them for viruses and defects." Thank You.  


