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Thank you Gina.

Smith, Tonya
Wednesday, February 17, 2021 1 :08 PM
Gina Carello
Hanson, Amy; Mobley, Prentice
RE: ELC Grant

From: Gina Carello <Gina.Carello@elcpalmbeach.org>
Sent: Wednesday, February 17, 202112:17 PM
To: Smith, Tonya <SmithTC@mydelraybeach.com>
Subject: RE: ELC Grant

............................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................................
iPlease be cautious
j This email originated from outside of The City of Delray Beach. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
¡__recognize..the_ sender _and _know_ the_content _is _safe ..

Good morning Tonya,
There are no restrictions on the spending of the CARES grants that were issued by the Office of Early Learning.
OEL has stated that providers will not be required to submit any supporting documentation for these grants. Providers
were asked on the Grant application to list a budget area that this funding might be spent toward but again OEL is not
asking for providers to supply any sort of documentation.

I am attaching the technical assistance documents I have from OEL regarding the distribution of these grants.
Please let me know if you have any other questions.

Thank you,
Gina Carello
Provider Services Director
Administrative Oice
Early Learning Coalition of Palm Beach County, Inc.
2300 High Ridge Road, Suite 115. Boynton Beach, Florida 33426
* (561) 214-7451 * fax (561) 745-3642 gina.carello@elcpalmbeach.org

Ifyou would like to make a donation to The Early Learning Coalition of Palm Beach County,
please contact the Community Foundation of Palm Beach County and the Treasure Coast:

www.vourcommunitvfoundation.org
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From: Smith, Tonya <SmithTC@mydelraybeach.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 17, 2021 9:25 AM
To: Gina Carello <Gina.Carello@elcpalmbeach.org>
Subject: FW: ELC Grant

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Good morning Gina,
Could you please read the email below and answer these questions and concerns that il received from Amy Hanson
(Asst. Director of Parks & Recreation) my supervisor.

Thank you.

From: Hanson, Amy <HansonA@mydelraybeach.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 17, 20219:14 AM
To: Smith, Tonya <SmithTC@mydelraybeach.com>; Mobley, Prentice <mobley@mydelraybeach.com>
Subject: RE: ELC Grant

Good morning Tonya and Prentice,
After our discussion yesterday evening, please hold off on spending the additional $5,750. This will need to go through
the ICM for approval to be placed on the agenda for Commission approval as we had to do for the $19,950. Please get
with Prentice and contact Gina with ELC. She will need to provide us an email stating if there are rules for use of the
funds including locations to be used for, any restrictions on time, items to purchase, etc. I would like to know if you will
be held to the specifics that you submitted originally and see this in writing. Please share the email with me once
complete.
Thank you,

Amy Hanson, C.P.R.P.
Assistant Director of Parks and Recreation
City of Delray Beach
Parks & Recreation Department
50 NW 1'Avenue
Delray Beach, FL 33444
P: 561-243-7000 Ext. 7136
HansonA@MyDelrayBeach.com

From: Smith, Tonya <SmithTC@mydelraybeach.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 16, 2021 4:58 PM
To: Cino, Brandon <inoB@mydelraybeach.com>
Cc: Hanson, Amy <HansonA@mydelraybeach.com>; Mobley, Prentice <mobley@mydelraybeach.com>
Subject: RE: ELC Grant

Hello Brandon,
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I thought the $2,500 and the $3,250 was included in the $7,980 and the 11,970 which is a total of $19,950). 1 went back
to look at the grant documents that I received from ELC. You're right those two figures are part of the reopening grants.
Sorry for the inconvenience. I hope this is not a problem.

See attachments and look on page #2 for Delay Beach Community Center and page #2 for Pompey Park Community
Center.

Thank you.

From: Cino, Brandon <ino@mydelraybeach.com>
Sent: Friday, February 12, 202112:48 PM
To: Smith, Tonya <SmithTC@mydelraybeach.com>
Cc: Hanson, Amy <HansonA@mydelraybeach.com>
Subject: ELC Grant

Hi Tonya,

I wanted to find out if you knew any information about the additional two deposits we received in the bank (attached) in
November from the ELC for $2,500.00 and $3,250.00. The description on the deposits is the same as the ones for the
reopening grants, so I wanted to see if we received any additional grants that you knew of.

Thank you!

Brandon Cino
Accountant
City of Delray Beach
561-243-7073

Please Note: Florida has a very broad public records law. Email communications may be subject to public disclosure.

3


